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INTRODUCTION

By Order of this Court dated February 7, 2013 (the “Initial Order”), Extreme Fitness,
Inc. (the “Applicant™) obtained protection from its creditors under the Companies’

Creditors Arrangement Act, R.S.C. 1985, ¢. C-36, as amended (the “CCAA™).

The Initial Order, among other things, granted a stay of proceedings until March 8, 2013,
or such later date as this Court may order, and appointed FT1 Consulting Canada Inc.
(“FTT”) as monitor (the “Monitor”) of the Applicant in these proceedings (the “CCAA
Proceedings™). The stay of proceedings was subsequently extended by Orders of this
Court to July 12, 2013.

At the time the CCAA Proceedings were commenced, the Applicant operated 13 fitness

facilities in the GTA and surrounding region with approximately 57,500 members.

The Applicant’s stated principal objectives of the CCAA Proceedings were: (i) to ensure
the ongoing operations of the Applicant; (ii) to ensure the Applicant has the necessary
availability of working capital funds to maximize the ongoing business of the Applicant
for the benefit of its stakeholders; and (iii) to complete a going concern sale and transfer

of the Applicant’s fitness facilities.



-

5. Further background information regarding the Applicant and the CCAA Proceedings is

provided in the affidavit of Alan Hutchens sworn February 7, 2013, filed in support of the

Applicant’s application for the Initial Order (the “Initial Affidavit”) and FIT's pre-filing

report dated February 7, 2013, copies of which have been posted on the Monitor’s

website for the CCAA Proceedings at http://cfeanada. fiiconsulting. com/Extremelitness

(the “Monitor’s Website™).

PURPOSE OF THIS REPORT

6. The purpose of this Fourth Report is to provide this Court with information and/or the

Monitor’s recommendations in respect of the following:

a)

b)

d)

the status of the CCAA Proceedings;

the Notices of Assessment received by the Applicant from Canada Revenue

Agency (“CRA”) dated April 10, 2013 (the “Notices of Assessment”);

the distribution of proceeds (the “Sale Proceeds™) from the sale transaction (the
“Sale Transaction™) between the Applicant and GoodLife Fitness Centres Inc.
(“GoodLife”) pursuant to the asset purchase agreement (the “APA™) entered into .
by the Applicant and GoodLife and the distribution of other funds in the
Applicant’s and in the Monitor’s possession to National Bank of Canada
(“National Bank™), as agent (the “National Bank Agent”), on behalf of the
lenders under the National Bank Credit Agreement (the “National Bank

Lenders”);
receipts and disbursements of the Applicant through June 28, 2013;
the termination of the CCAA Proceedings and the discharge of the Monitor; and

the Monitor’s activities since its appointment and professional fees.



TERMS OF REFERENCE

In preparing this report, FTI has relied upon unaudited financial information of the
Applicant, the Applicant’s books and records, certain financial information prepared by,

and discussions with, the Applicant’s management.

Capitalized terms not otherwise defined herein have the meaning given to them in the
Initial Affidavit and the affidavit of Alan Hutchens sworn July 4, 2013 (the “Hutchens
Affidavit™). This report should be read in conjunction with the Huichens Affidavit as
certain information contained in the Hutchens Affidavit has not been included herein in
order to avoid unnecessary duplication. A copy of the Hutchens Affidavit is available on

the Monitor’s Website.

Unless otherwise stated, all monetary amounts contained in this report are expressed in

Canadian dollars.

STATUS OF THE CCAA PROCEEDINGS

10.

1.

On March 27, 2013, this Cowrt made an Order, inter alia: (i) approving the Sale
Transaction; and (ii) vesting in GoodLife all of the Applicant’s right, title and interest in

and to the Purchased Assets (as defined in the APA).

On March 27, 2013, this Court made an Order (the “Ancillary Order™), infer alia,
authorizing the Monitor to: (1) make certain distributions from the Sale Proceeds to: (1)
Golub Capital Incorporated, as agent, on behalf of the lenders party to the DIP Credit
Agreement in respect of the amounts advanced to the Applicant under the DIP Credit
Agreement plus interest and costs; (2) the Applicant in respect of its post-filing
obligations, including liabilities intended to be protected by the Administration Charge
and the D&O Charge, and any monetary defaults in respect of leases assigned to
GoodLife; (3) Golub Capital Incorporated, as agent, on behalf of the lenders under the
Priority Credit Agreement in respect of the amounts advanced to the Applicant under the
Priority Credit Agreement plus interest and costs; and (4) the National Bank Agent, on
behalf of the National Bank Lenders in partial satistaction of the Applicant’s outstanding



12.

13.
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indebtedness to the NBC Lenders (the “Enterim Distributions™); and (ii) make further
distributions to the National Bank Agent, on behalf of the National Bank Lenders, from
the Sale Proceeds and additional funds that come into the Monitor’s possession 1n respect

of the assets or property of the Applicant.

The Sale Transaction closed at 11:59 p.m. on March 31, 2013 (the “Closing Date”) and
the Effective Time of the Sale Transaction under the APA was 12:01 am. on April 1,
2013.  Following the closing of the Sale Transaction, there are no material assets
remaining, other than the proceeds from the Sale Transaction held by the Monitor and
funds in the Applicant’s possession to be distributed to the Applicant’s creditors (as

discussed below).

On May 9, 2013, this Court made an Order (the “May 9 Order™), inter alia: (i) extending
the stay of proceedings to July 12, 2013; (ii) authorizing the Monitor to release from the
reserve of $430,000 being held by the Monitor pursuant to the Endorsement of the
Honourable Mr. Justice Morawetz dated March 27, 2013 (the “Danforth Lease
Reserve”) to 1079268 Ontario Inc. (the “Danforth Landlord™) the amount specified in
the settlement agreement and release dated May 9, 2013 between the Applicant and the
Danforth Landlord (the “Settlement Amount™); and (iii) authorizing the Monitor to
release the remainder of the Danforth Lease Reserve in accordance with paragraphs 10

and 11 of the Ancillary Order.

NOTICES OF ASSESSMENT

14.

As discussed in the Third Report of the Monitor dated May 1, 2013 (the “Third
Report™), CRA has taken the position that certain group fitness instructors under contract
with the Applicant prior to completion of the Sale Transaction were employees of the
Applicant and not independent contractors. In connection therewith, CRA issued the
Notices of Assessment to the Applicant on April 10, 2013 in respect of taxation vears
2011, 2012 and 2013 in connection with source deductions under the Income Tax Act
(Canada) in the aggregate amount of approximately $374,000 that CRA posits should
have been deducted in relation to these group fitness instructors (collectively, the “CRA
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Assessed Amount”). Of the CRA Assessed Amount, approximately $32,413 relates to
the post-filing period.

On July 2, 2013, the Applicant filed an objection with respect to the Notices of
Assessment. As of the date hereof, the amounts owing by the Applicant, if any, have yet

to be determined.

DISTRIBUTIONS

16.

17.

18.

19,

a) Sale Proceeds

As discussed in the Third Report, following the closing of the Sale Transaction, the

Monitor completed the Interim Distributions in accordance with the Ancillary Order.

Pursuant to the May 9 Order, the Monitor released the Settlement Amount to the
Danforth Landlord and distributed the remainder of the Danforth Lease Reserve in

accordance with the Ancillary Order.

As discussed in the Third Report, the APA required the Monitor to hold in escrow the
Holdback (as defined in the APA) in respect of the Adjustment Amount (as defined in the
APA) from the cash portion of the purchase price paid by GoodLife under the APA unti
the later of 90 days following the Closing Date and the date on which the Adjustment
Amount, if any, was settled between the parties. Upon agreement by the Applicant and
GooaLife that the Adjustment Amount was $495,827 in GoodLife’s favour, the Monitor,
in accordance with the terms of the APA and with the consent of GoodLife, released the
Adjustment Amount to GoodLife and the remainder of the Holdback (afier a payment to
Integrity Square LLC as described below) was released to the Monitor for the benefit of
the Applicant.

In connection with the completion of the Sale Transaction and with the consent of the
Applicant and National Bank, approximately $20,083 from the Holdback was paid to

Integrity Square LLC in respect of an advisory fee pursuant to its engagement agreement
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with the Applicant in connection with financial advisory services provided to the
Applicant relating to the marketing and sale of the Applicant’s assets and business, which

culminated in the Sale Transaction.

In connection with the Administration Charge and the D&O Charge granted pursuant to
the Initial Order, reserves in the amounts of $500,000 and $2,880,000, respectively
(collectively, the “Administration and D&O Charge Reserves™) were initially withheld
from the Sale Proceeds. In connection with the proposed termination of these CCAA
Proceedings and the Charges (as defined and further discussed below), the
Administration and D&O Charge Reserves will be distributed by the Monitor to the
National Bank Agent, on behalf of the National Bank Lenders.

The Monitor has approximately $5,779,000 remaining in its possession (including with
respect to the Ad.ministration and D&O Charge Reserves), which amount, less any
banking fees, will be distributed to the National Bank Agent on behalf of the National
Bank Lenders, in aceordance with the Ancillary Order.

by Additional Funds

i  RBC Holdback

As discussed in the Initial Affidavit, the Applicant was required to maintain a minimum
aggregate cash balance of $500,000 (the “RBC Holdback™) in its bank accounts with
Royal Bank of Canada (“RBC™) as security for RBC’s services and the obligations of the
Applicant under its agreement with RBC.

In connection with the closure of the Applicant’s bank accounts with RBC on July 2,
2013, the Applicant reached an agreement with RBC for the staggered release of the RBC
Holdback. In accordance with this agreement, as of the date hereof, $450,000 of the
RBC Holdback has been released by RBC to the Applicant, with the remaining $50,000,
less any deductions for pre-authorized payment returns and applicable services charges,

schelluled to be released to the Applicant on or around July 8, 2013. These amounts will



24,

25.

26.

27.

28.

-7-

be distributed by the Applicant to the National Bank Agent, on behalf of the National

Bank Lenders in accordance with the requested Order.
ii.  Paymentech Deposit

As discussed in the Initial Affidavit, the Applicant had also provided a cash deposit in an
amount of $900,000 (the “Paymentech Deposit”) to Chase Paymentech Solutions, for
itself and on behalf of The Bank of Nova Scotia and First Data Loan Company, Canada

(collectively, “Paymentech”™) as security for Paymentech’s services and the obligations

 of the Applicant under its agreement with Paymentech (the “Paymentech Agreement”).

On June 24, 2013, the Applicant entered into an agreement with Paymentech for the
staggered release of the Paymentech Deposit (the “Paymentech Release Agreement”),
with the final portion of the Paymentech Deposit to be released on or before October 15,
2013, subject to Paymentech conducting a final risk review prior to October 15, 2013 and
determining that there is no continuing risk on the Applicant’s merchant account with

Paymentech for amounts owing pursuant to the terms of the Paymentech Agreement.

To date, $500,000 of the Paymentech Deposit has been released to the Applicant pursuant
to the Paymentech Release Agreement, which amount will be distributed to the National
Bank Agent, on behalf of the National Bank Lenders in accordance with the requested
Order.

The Paymentech Release Agreement also provides that after expiry of the stay period in
these CCAA Proceedings, the remainder of the Paymentech Deposit shall be paid directly
to National Bank, subject to any set offs and deductions by Paymentech of amounts it is

entitled to deduct in accordance with the Paymentech Release Agreement.

The Applicant currently has an aggregate amount of approximately $800,000 in its
possession (including the amounts of the RBC Holdback and Paymentech Deposit
released to date), which amount, less a reserve of approximately $40,197 (the “CRA

Reserve™) with respect to that portion of the Notices of Assessment relating to the post-



-8-

filing period, plus estimated penalties and interest if the Applicant’s objection is not

successful, to be held by Aird & Berlis LLP in trust pending the resolution, following

termination of these CCAA Proceedings, of the Notices of Assessment (as further

discussed above), and less any fees and costs, will be distributed to the National Bank

Agent on behalf of the National Bank Lenders, in accordance with the requested Order.

RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS TO JUNE 28, 2013

29, The Affidavit of Alan Hutchens sworn May 1, 2013, in support of the Applicant’s motion

for the May 9 Order included a cash flow forecast for the Applicant for the eleven-week

period ending July 12, 2013 (the “Current Cash Flow Forecast”). The table below

presents the actual versus forecast results of the Applicant’s Cash Flow Forecast for the

nine-week period ending June 28, 2013.

For the Period April 27 to June 28, 2013

Cash Flow from Operations

Receipts 900.5 944.1 43.6
Total Receipts 900.5 944.1 43.6
Payroll and related amounts 118.2 124.8 (6.6)
Facility costs 54.9 8.0 47.0
Operating costs 167.5 182.8 {15.3)
Professional fees 500.0 4281 71.9
Total Disbursements 840.6 743.7 96.9
Net Operating Cash Flow 59.9 200.3 140.4
Beginning Cash Balance 7005 700.5 -

Net Cash Flow 59.9 200.3 140.4
Ending Cash Balance 760.4 900.8 140.4

30. For the ninc weeks ending June 28, 2013, the Applicant reported net operating cash

inflows of approximately $200.3 thousand, a positive variance of approximately $140.4

thousand compared to the Current Cash Flow Forecast.
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The positive variance in Net Operating Cash Flow was primarily the result of:

a) lower-than-forecast disbursements for facility costs due to timing differences

related to cure payments associated with the assignment of certain leases;
b) a positive variance in professional fees; and

¢) . apositive variance in net credit card collections.

TERMINATION OF THE CCAA PROCEEDINGS

32.

33.

The Monitor is of the view that upon the distribution of the remaining Sale Proceeds and
any additional funds in the Applicant’s and in the Monitor’s possession, the Applicant’s
and the Monitor’s duties and responsibilities under the Orders granted in these CCAA
Proceedings will have been completed, but for any matters that may be incidental to the
termination of these CCAA Proceedings and payment of the outstanding remaining fees
of the Monitor, its counsel and the Applicant’s counsel. Accordingly, the Monitor
believes it is appropriate for the CCAA Proceedings to be terminated and for the DIP
Charge, the Administration Charge and the D&O Charge (collectively, the “Charges™) to
be released, subject to.the D&O Charge continuing solely as against the CRA Reserve
pending the resolution, following termination of these CCAA Proceedings, of the Notices

of Assessment.

Upon completion of all matiers to be attended to in connection with the CCAA
Proceedings to the satisfaction of the Monitor, the Monitor will file a certificate with this
Court certifying that all matters to be attended to in connection with the CCAA

Proceedings have been completed to the satisfaction of the Monitor.

OVERVIEW OF THE MONITOR’S ACTIVITIES

34.

Since its appointment, the Monitor has been involved with numerous aspects of the
CCAA Proceedings with a view to fulfilling its statutory and court-ordered duties and

obligations, as well as assisting the Applicant and its stakeholders in addressing the



35.

-10 -

Applicant’s restructuring issues, The Monitor’s activities have included, but are not

limited to, the following:

a)

b)

2

h)

1)

k)

)

publishing required notices and completing statutory filings;

assisting with the negotiation and completion of the Sale Transaction;
responding to enquiries of creditors and other interested parties;
assisting with the review of contracts to be assigned or disclaimed;

conducting a review of the security held by the Applicant’s principal secured

creditors;
reviewing correspondence and participating in discussions with CRA;

reviewing correspondence and motion materials and participating in discussions
in connection with the assignment of the lease agreement between the Applicant

and the Danforth Landlord and related settlement matters;

corresponding and working with the Applicant’s counsel and counsel to the
Applicant’s principal secured creditors and various other interested parties and

their counsel;

monitoring the Applicant’s receipts and disbursements;

attending at Court for the various motions in the CCAA Proceedings;

preparing reports in connection with the motions in the CCAA Proceedings; and

maintaining the Monitor’s Website and posting all Court materials in these CCAA

Proceedings thereon.

In addition to the approval of the Monitor’s activities, the Applicant’s proposed Order

includes a release of the Monitor from any liability for any act or omission pertaining to

the discharge of the Monitor’s duties in the CCAA Proceedings or with respect to any
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other duties or obligations of the Monitor under the CCAA or otherwise, other than any
liability arising out of any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the part of the

Monttor.

PROFESSIONAL FEES

36.

The Monitor and its counsel have maintained detailed records of their professional costs
and time during the course of the CCAA Proceedings, as detailed in the affidavit of Paul
Bishop sworn July 4, 2013, a copy of which is attached hereto as Appendix “A”, and the
Affidavit of Melaney J. Wagner sworn July 4, 2013, a copy of which is attached hereto as
Appendix “B” (together, the “Fee Affidavits”). The Monitor and its counsel have also
provided in their respective Fee Affidavits estimates of the fees and disbursements of the
Monitor and its legal counsel in connection with the completion by the Monitor of its

remaining duties and the administration of these CCAA Proceedings.

RECOMMENDATIONS AND CONCLUSIONS

37.

38.

The Monitor believes it is appropriate for the CCAA Proceedings to be terminated,
including the release of the Charges, subject to the D&O Charge continuing solely as
against the CRA Reserve pending the resolution, following termination of these CCAA

Proceedings, of the Notices of Assessment.

The Monitor respectfully requests that the Court approve this Fourth Report and the
activities described herein, as well as the fees and disbursements of the Monitor and its

counsel as outlined in the Fee Affidavits.



All of which is respectfully submitted this 4™ day of July, 2013,

FTI Consulting Canada Inc.,
in its capacity as the Monitor of Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Per
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Steven Bissell
Managing Director
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Court File No. CV-13-10000-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES CREDITORS’
ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, ¢. C-36, AS AMENDED

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR
ARRANGEMENT OF EXTREME FITNESS, INC.

AFFIDAVIT OF PAUL BISHOP
(Sworn July 4, 2013)

I, PAUL BISHOP, of the City of Toronto in the Province of Ontario MAKE OATH
AND SAY:

l. I am a Senior Managing Director of FTI Consulting Canada Inc. (“FTT”), the Court-
appointed Monitor (the “Monitor”) of Extreme Fitness, Inc. (the “Applicant”™) in these
proceedings (the “CCAA Proceedings™). As such, [ have knowledge of the matters hereinafter
deposed to.

2. This Affidavit 1s made in support of a motion secking, infer alia, the approval of the fees

and disbursements of the Monitor and its legal counsel during the CCAA Proceedings.

3. Attached hereto cbliectively as Exhibit “A” are copies of the accounts rendered by FTI to
the Applicant for the period from February 7, 2013 to June 30, 2013, in the total amount of
$175,159.39, including Harmonized Sales Tax (“HST”), in connection with the CCAA
Proceedings, redacted for confidential information. The estimated fees and disbursements for

FTI from June 30, 2013 to the completion of the CCAA Proceedings are approximately $10,000.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit “B” is a schedule summarizing each invoice in Exhibit “A”,

including the fees, expenses, HST and total fees charged in each invoice.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit “C” is a schedule summarizing the billing rates and total
amounts billed with respect to each member of FTI that rendered services in the CCAA

Proceedings.
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6. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by FTI throughout the course of the
CCAA Proceedings are comparable to the rates charged by other firms in the Toronto market for

the provision of similar restructuring services.

7. The hours spent on this matter involved monitoring the Applicant and deal'ing with a
number of CCAA issues (as more particularly described in the Monitor’s reports in these CCAA
Proceedings) and I believe that the total hours incurred by FTI were reasonable and appropriate

in the circumstances,

8. FTI requests that the Court approve its accounts for services rendered and recorded from
February 7, 2013 to June 30, 2013 for fees in the amount of $151,484.50, disbursements in the
amount of $3,523.79 and HST in the amount of $20,151.10, and its estimated fees and
disbursements to the completion of the CCAA Proceedings in the amount of $10,000.

SWORN before me at the City of Toronto, )
Ontario, this 4™ day of July, 2013.

(&% i %J 2@;—5 Y

A Commissioner for Oaths in and for the Paul Bishop
Province of Ontario /



This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the
affidavit of Paul Bishop
sworn before me, this 4"

day of July, 2013.

=

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits
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FTT Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON MSK1G8

February 15,2013

Mr, Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000511

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through February 10, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

X

Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration No. 835718024 RT0001



Invoice Remittance
Mr. Alan Futchens February 15, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FT1 Invoice No. 29000511
8281 Yonge Street FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Thomhill, ON L3 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation

Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through February 10, 2013

Professional SeIVICES. ..ou e crecrercserc e e s me e bbb s et sh s sae s annees

EXPENISES. i ittt s

Total Fees and EXPENnSes. . oo v it en e

HST Registration No. 835718024RT00071 ..o,

Total Amount Due this Period.........ovveeeeereerereereoeerrenen, : , $32,642.31
Total AmountDue..............cocoooei | $32.642.31

Please Wire Transfer To:

Bank of Nova Scotia::.
Scotia Plaza,
Toronto, O

Bar

HS'I' Registration No. 835718024RT0001



Invoice Summary

CONSULTING

Mr. Alan Hutchens February 15, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No, 29000511
8281 Yonge Street FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Thornhitl, ON L3T 2C7 ] Terms Payment on Presentation
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through February 10, 2013

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop Senior Managing Dircctor $830.00 4.2 $3,486.00
Steven Bisscll Managing Director $710.00 17.7 $12,567.00
Peter Taylor Senior Censultant $460.00 279 $12,834.00
Total Hours and Fees 498 $28,887.00
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $3,755.31
Invoice Total for Current Period $32,642.31

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001



Extreme Fitness
419584.0004 - February 10, 2013

Invoice # 29000511

Date

TK#

Name Hours

Amount

Narrative

02/05/13
02/06/13
02/07/13
02/08/13

02/04/13

02/05/13

02/06/13

02/0713
02/08/13

02/01/13

02/04/13

02/05/13

02/06/13

020713

02/08/13

14800
14800
14800
14800

14856

14856

14856

14856

14856

15120

15120

15120

15120

18120

15120

Paul Bishco 0.90
Paul Bishep 0.90
Paul Bishop 1.10
Paul Bishop 1.30

Steven Bissell 270

Steven Bissell 5.00

Steven Bisseil 4.00

Steven Bissell 4.00
Sieven Bissell 2.00

Brogan Tayior 4.20

Brogan Taylor 2,30

Brogan Taylor 7.00

Brogan Taylor 7.60

Brogan Tayior 3.20

Bragan Taylor 3.60

LR -

747,00
747,00
913.00
1,079.00

1,917.00

3,550.00

2,840.00

2,840.00

1,420.00

1,932.00

1,058.00

3,220.00

3,496.00

1,472.00

1,656.00

Filing preparation

Filing prep

Fiting pren

Update status with lenders other calis

Review of revised motion materials and comments on same, including draft
Initiai Order, Affidavit and pre-filing Monitor's report.

Review and comments on various draft motion materials including initiat order,
affidavit, press release and pre-filing monitor's report. Review of forbearance
agreements and CCAA cash flow forecast. Cail with senior lenders re: cash
flow forecast and DIP

Filing preparation including review and comments on various motion materials,
Calis with Monitor's legal counsel. Review of final CCAA cash flow forecast
and email correspondence with Senior Lenders and financial advisor to debtor
re: same.

Final edits to Monitor's pre-filing report. Emali correspendence with Monitor's
legal counsel and A&M re: same. Preparation for and participation on hearing
conference call. On-site visit to Extreme headquarters. Meeting with G. Karpet
re: post-filing pla

Hearing call and post-fifing coordination and pianning.

On site at Extreme’s head office:Meetings with management to review CCAA
preparation materials and filing cash flow forecasts, review support to cash
flow revenue forecast, calls with National Bank representatives and internal
discussions in respect finan

CCAA prep work including reviewing documents, setting up the Monitor's
hotline, website and email inbox, making changes and edits to filing and
communication materlals, calls with National Bank and Company
management

CCAA prep work, reviewing filing cash flow forecasts, drafting of newspaper
advertisement, reviewing draft filing materials and communication materiais,
calls with management and lender, final prep work for Monitor's website and
hotline, testing of Monito

Final prep for CCAA filing - review drafis of al! filing materials and calls with
management and lenders {e finalize details, complele setup of Monitor's
website, holline and email inbox with IT, finalize draft language and script for
website and hotline

On site at Extreme’s head office:initial tele-hearing with Justice Campbeii, go
five with all requirements per the Initial Order, conference calls with legal
ceunsel and discussions with management in respect of how best to move
forward

Atiend second tele-hearing with Justice Campbeli, organize newspaper
advertisement, check Monitor's hotiine and inbox, correspondence with
internai team and company's management in respect of varfous items, ensure
alt documents are posted to the Monitor's

TOTAL

49.80

28,887.00
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CONSULTING

FT1 Consulting Canada inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON M5K1G8

February 24, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FT1 Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000520

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through February 17, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

A

-

% T
A o A

 Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration No., 83571 8024RT0001
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Invoice Remittance
Mr. Alan Hutchens February 24, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTT Invoice No. 29000520
8281 Yonge Street FTIJob No. 431696.0001
Thomhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms; Payment on Presentation
Canada
Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through February 17, 2013

CAD ($)

Professional Services..........ccovvverenn.. e e e e ©811,413.50
R g e 0 L=r- T SRRSO e 856.20

Total Fees and EXPenSes. ... orenrireriveeireeereneenneerareeeseeeeeee e e e

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

Total Amount Due this Period $12.960.76

Previous Balance Due........ccccoeviiiiiciiiiecienene, $32.642.31

Total Amount Due........ | e $45.603.07

eficiar TIbonsuIting Canada Inc.
Beneficiary account number: 476960861715

HST Registraticn Ne. 835718024RT0001
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: . ; Invoice Summary
CORNIULTING
Mr. Altan Hutchens February 24, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTT Invoice No. 29000520
8281 Yonge Street i FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Thomhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms Payment on Presentation
Canada
Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through February 17, 2013
Name ' Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop Senior Managing Director $830.00 2.4 $1,992.00
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 59 $4,189.00
Peter Taylor Senior Consultant $460.00 11.2 $5,152.00
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional $115.00 0.7 $80.50
Total Hours and Fees 20.2 $11,413.50
Mileage $56.20
Total Expenses $56.20
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $1,491.06
Invoice Total for Cuarrent Period $12.960.76

HST Registration No. 8357 18024R'T0001



Extreme Fithess
419584.0004 - February 17, 2013

Invoice # 29000520
Date TKH Name Hours Amount Narrative
02/13/13 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00  Preparing draft invoice for pericd ending February 10, 2013.
02/15/M13 152Y3  Ana Arevalo 0.30 $ 34.50 Finalizing inveoice for peried ending February 10, 2013.
02111113 14800  Paul Bishop 1.20 $ 996.00  Status update, call with lender, review of correspondence
0211313 14800  Paul Bishop 0.80 $ 664.00 Status review
02/14/13 14800  Paul Bishop 0.40 $ 332.00 Update
0211113 14856  Steven Bissell : 1:00 5 710.00 Past-filing matters including discussions with interim CFQ and Centroller re:
’ ' disbursements, employes issues, and statutory reporting.
) : . Calis with A&M and National Bank re: potential KERPs, Review and edits to
02/12/13 14856 ° Steven Bissell 2.20 $ 1.562.00 CCAA notices and follow-up re: reporting of same pursuant to CCAA.
02/13/15 14856 Stoven Bissell . 0.50 5 455.00 Calis with Monitor's legal counsel, A&M re; KERP. Call with vendor re: post-
' ’ filing services and payment of same.
. Calls with A&M re: status of KERP and follow-up with Monitor's legal counsel.
. Cafl with Extreme HR staff re: employee-related issues in CCAA, Calls with
02114113 14856 - Steven Bissell 2.20 $ 1.562.00 interested party re: sale of Extrerne assets. Call with Ministry of Labour re:
status of employee-relat
Cooerdinate mailing of notices, printing of newspaper ad, and submission of
02/11/13 15120  Broaan Tavior 4.40 3 2 024.00 0SB forms. Correspondence with interim management teamn and NBC team in
9 ¥ ' e respect of pre-filing and post-filing cheques, arrange to have materials posted
to the Monitor's website, and
Review disbursement requests, coordinate mailing of notices, finalize listing of
creditors with addresses and arrange tc have it posted to the Menitor's
02712113 15120 qugan Taylor . 3.20 $ 1,472.00 website, responde to enguiries received via the Monitor's hotline and email
inbox.
02/13/13 15120  Brogan Tayior . 0.50 $ 230.00 Review disbursement requests and correspondence with interim management
On site at Extreme Fitness head office:Review disbursement requests,
02/14/13 15120 Brogan Tavlor 560 $ 1.196.00 meetings and discussions with interim management in respect of critical
9 y ' U supplier payments and various other types of disbursements as well as the
developments in respect of the KERP disc
02715113 15120  Brogan Taylor 0.50 3 23000 Review disbursement requests and cofrespondence with interim

management.

TOTAL 20.20 $ 11,413.50
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CONIBSULTING
FT1 Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON M5K1G8

February 28, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000525

Eneclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice eovers protessional fees and expenses through February 28, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoiec or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Eneclosures

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001



Invoice Remittance

Mr, Alan Hutchens

Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street

February 28, 2013
FTI Invoice No. 29000523
FTT fob No. 431696.000t

Thormhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation

Canada

Current Invoice Period; Charges'Posted through February 28, 2013

cap )

Professional SErVICES......cv ittt ettt et sre e $2318750
DX DEINSES ottt ettt e ettt ettt an et et eere et . ..$0.00
Total Fees and EXPenses... ... sieaesnesens s st eveesneens e - ) $23,18750
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 ©$3.014.38
Total Amount Due this Period $26,201.88
Previous Balance Due......ccocvivvcnirinnnnn e $45.603.07
Total Amount Due............... . $71,804.95

Please Wire Trans

RST Registration No, 835718024RT0001
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CONSULTING

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through February 28, 2013

Invoice Summary

February 28, 2013

FTI Invoice No. 29000525

FTT Job No. 431696,0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop Senior Managing Director $830.00 2.4 $1,992.00
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 19.6 $13,916.00
Peter Taylor Senior Consultant $460.00 15.2 $6,992.00
Erin Litwin Senior Consultant $460.00 0.3 $138.00
Ana Arevalo Administrati ve Professional $115.00 0.7 $80.50
Linda Kelly Administrative Receptionist $115.00 0.6 $69.00

Total Hours and Fees

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

Invoice Total for Cuarrent Period

33.8 $23,187.50

$3,014.38

$26,201.88

HST Registration No, B35718024RTOG01



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - February 28, 2013
Invoice # 23000525

Date TKi# Name Hours Amount  Narrative
02/2013 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00 Preparing draft invoice for period ending February 17, 2013,
02/24{13 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.30 ) © 34.50 Finalizing invoice for period ending February 17, 2013.
02/26/13 14800  PaulBishop 0.80 $ 747.00 Status update
02/21113 14800 . Paul Bishop Q.70 $ 581.00 Status update
02/19/13 14800  Paul Bishop 0.80 $ 664.00 Status update
02/22113 14856  Steven Bissell - 0.30 $ 213.00 Call with Goocdmans re: interested party LOL

Monitor's bank account set-up. Discusslons with P. Bishop re: status of
02/2113 14856  Steven Bissell 1.00 $ 710.00 engagement. Call with legal counsel to interested party. Review of LOI from
’ . interested party.

Review and comments on draft Asset Purchase Agreement. Call with A&M re:

02720113 14856 . Steven Bissel 470 $ 8,387.00 status of dus diiigence. Call with Monitor's legal counsel re: draft APA,
Call with 8. Graff and M. Wagner re: Extreme sales process. Review of actuai
. t its for wi din, bi 15th, Revi nd com ts on
02H913 14856  Steven Bisseil 390 $ 2.430.00 vs. budget resuits for week ending February eview and comments ol

KERP motion materials and draft KERP agreement. Call with iegal counsel for
interested party re: sales pr

Call with A&M re: status of due diligence and sales process. Call with Extreme
02/28/13 14856  Steven Bissell 0.80 $ 568.00 HR manager re: empicyee-related issues. Cail with M. Wagner re: employee-

related issues.

Review of employee issues and claims and follow up with Extreme staff re:

0212713 14856  Steven Bisseli 0.50 $ 355.00 same.
Review and commenis on Monitor's First Report. Review of KERP letter,
: . Fmail correspondence with A&M re: KERP and lease notice. Call with CRA re:
02126113 14856 Sfeven Bissel 480 § 3.195.00 information requests. Review of preliminary iease notice. Review of HRTO
notice and call with L. Bradely re: s
) Preparation of Monitor's First report including calls with Monitor's legal counsel
. ‘ . : and legal counsel to NBC., Review of actual vs forecast results for weekly cash
021‘25"13 14856 Steven Bissel 4.80 3 3,408.00 flows and discussions with B. Taylor re: summary of same for Moniter's report.
Review of draf
02/27/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.40 $ 46.00 Uploading documents to the website.
02/26113 18441  Linda Kelly 0.20 $ 23.00  Uploading documents to the Extreme Fitness website,

02/25/13 18126  Erin Litwin 0.30 $ 138.00 General file administration.

Review disbursements, review draft KERP agreement and, review cash flow
02/19M13 15120  Brogan Taylor 1.20 ) 552.00 variance reporting and reconcile to disbursement records, arrange posting of
court documents to Monitor's website, respond to email and hotline enquirfes

Review draft APA agreement and meeting to censolidate comments with legal

02/20/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 230 §  1,058.00 counsel, review disbursements
Review distribution listing, prep and arrange the posting of court matertals and
0221113 15120  Brogan Taylor 460 $ 736.00 revised service lists to the Monitor's website, respond te enquiries recelved via

emall and the Monltor's hotline, review draft affidavit in respect of KERP
motion

02/22/13 15420  Brogan Taylor 0.80 % 268.00 Review unsolicited LOI receive review disbursement

listing and backup materials related to pro-rated payments,

Review disbursements, create cash flow varlance reperting schedule for
Monitor's repart and populate with most recent data available, review draft
motion materials in respect of KERP and stay extension, review and provide
comment on the draft Monitor's re

02/25/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 3.20 3 1,472.00

Revlew, comment and finalize Informatlon for the First Monitor's Report,
update website with court fillng documents, correspondence with Interim
Management, review disbursements, reconcile disbursements reviewed to
date with cash flow variance report, pos

02/26/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 4.30 $ 1,878.00

Revise table data in draft Monitor's report, arrange posting of materials to the

022713 15120 Brogan Taylor 1.00 $ 460.00 Monitor's website, review disbursements,

Revlew disbursements, arrange o have maierials posted tc the Monitor's

0228113 15120 Brogan Taylor 0.80 $ 368.00 website, update cummulative disbursement tracking workbook

TOTAL 38.80 $ 23,187.50
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CONISULTING

FTT Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON MK 1GE

March 21, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000543

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through March 17, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,
. e

o
st 3 s
Gt PR

5 i -
o e s e e

M Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration No, 835718024RT0001



Invoice Remittance

Mr, Alan Hutchens March 21, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No. 29000543
8281 Yonge Street FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation
Canada '

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through March 17, 2013

cap (5)
Professional SEIVICES.......oviiiietie e ittt srecree e e err e cene e ettt e e il 4,56150
FEXEIISES. ... vever s ereverereneasemeaesebesesce st eniaes s s rar st e s s e s r e en s e — $338108
Total Fees and EXPEnSes. ......ccc.oiiiimiin i T 1,942
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 ....cccoccvnvciniiniinininiinn $233254

Total Amount Due this Period $20,275.12

Previous Balance DUC.......vrovveeoveererinnen. - $26.201.88

Total Amount DUe.............cbe. i e $46,477.00

Please Wire Transfe

Benef jary account number: 476960861715

HST Registration No. §35718024RT0001
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CONSULTING

Mr, Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thombhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through March 17, 2013

Invoice Summary

March 21, 2013

FTT Invoice No. 29000543

FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop Senior Managing Director $830.00 Il $913.00
Steven Bissell , Managing Director $710.00 6.8 $4.828.00
Peter Taylor Senior Consultant $460.00 18.7 $8,602.00
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional $i15.00 1.1 $126.50
Linda Kelly Administrative Receptionist $115.00 0.8 $92.60

Total Hours and Fees

28.5 $14,561.50

Mileage $63.60
Other/Miscellaneous $3.251.65
Transportation $65.83
Total Expenses $3,381.08
HST Registration No. 835718024RT000% $2,332.54
Invoice Total for Current Period $20,275.12

HST Registration No. 8357 18024RT0001



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - March 17, 2013

Invoice # 29000543

Date TKH# Name Hours Amount Narrative
03/01/13 15273  Anpa Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00  Preparing draft invoice for pericd ending February 28, 2013,
03/04/13 15273 Ana Arevalo 0.30 $ 34,50 Finalizing invoice for period ending February 28, 2013.
03/12113 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00 Preparing draft invoice for period ending March 10, 2013.
03/08/13 14800  Paui Bishop 1.10 $ 913.00 Update status
invoice of fees and reconciliation of actual vs. budget professional fees.
03/05/13 14856  Steven Bissell 1.80 $ 1,278.00 Conference call with A&M re: due diligence and LOI. Review of letter from
creditor and email correspondence with National Bank.
. Preparation for, and attendance in court re; Stay Extension and KERP hearing.
03/07/13 - 14856  Steven Bissel 3.00 $ 2.130.00 Review and comments on craft APA.
03/08/13 14856  Steven Bissel 0.50 $ 355.00 Cail with Monitor's iegal counsel to review draft APA and consolidate
‘ ' comments.
. Review of updated realization analysis. Preparaticn for and call with A&M re:
03115/13 14856 Steven Bissell 1.50 $ 1,085.00 status of APA and due diligence. Follow up with B. Taylor re: same.
03/11/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.20 $ 23.00 Waebsite Updating
03/07/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.30 $ 34,50 Uploacding documents to website.
03/06/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.10 $ 11.50 Uploading documents to the website
03/04/13 18441 Linda Keily 0.20 $ 23,00 Uploading documents to website
Review disbursement requests, correspondence with interim management in
03/1113 ° 15120 Brogan Taylor 220 $ 1,012.00 respect of the draft APA and on-going discussions with Goedlife on the
working capital adjustments, coordinate website updates.
Review updated draft working capital adjusttment and proceeds analysis,
correspondence with interim management, review disbursements, review draft
03/12/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 5.00 $ 1,380.00 APA and discuss changes internally, review cash fiow variance reporting and
reconcile balances.
Review disbursement requests, correspondence with Interim Management in
031313 15120 Brogan Taylor 0.70 $ 322,00 respect of updates on working capital discussions with GoodLife.
Update calls with interim management anc legat counsel with respect of on-
. going APA refinements and working capital adjustrnent negotiations. Review
03/1413 15120 Brogan Taylor 2.00 3 920.00 disbursement requests, correspondence with lega! counse! in respect of APA
and working capital adjustments.
Correspondence with National Bank representatives in respect of draft
recovery analysis prepared by interim management team, calis with interim
03/15/13 16120 Brogan Taylor 200 3 920.00 management in respect of on-going discussions and negotiations with the APA
and working capital adjustments, co
03/01/13 15120  Brogan Tavior 0.50 $ 230.00 Review disbursement requests and correspondence with interim
9 ¥ ' ' management.
03/04/13 15120 Bro‘ an Tavior 190 $ 552 00 Update service list posted to Monitor's website, correspondence with interim
: 9 Y ’ ’ management, review disbursements.
On site at Extreme’s head office:Correspondence in respect of professional
: fee payments not yet cleared, upcdate recovery analysis, update meeting with
03/05/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 4.50 $ 2,070.00 interim management, review auto debit transactions in respect to payroil,
benefits and taxes, review dis
Correspondence with interitn management, review disbursements, coordinate
03/06/13 15120 Brogan Tayior 0.60 $ 276.00 posting of updated service list o Monitor's website
Review draft APA, attend conference call with legal to discuss cotnments on
03/08/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 2.00 3 920.00 draft APA, correspondence with interim management, review disbursements
TOTAL 28.50 $ 14,561.50
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COWISULTING
FT1 Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Bex 104
Toronto ON MSK1GS

March 27, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTIJob No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000548

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through March 24, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration No, 835718024RT000]
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CONSULTIN

Invoice Remittance
Mr. Alan Hutchens March 27, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc, FTT Invoice No, 29000548
8281 Yonge Street FTI Job No, 431696.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation
Canada
Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through March 24, 2013

CAD ()

Professional SEIrvICES. ..ot re e e e e s stiae e et e e tastet e seaenreaeeaaneeeeaneeeee e enns

L 0L 1= OO S TR P SO UR PP UFTOURORPPOO

Total Fees and EXPenSes.......cooiiiirii ittt sttt et R $21,48600
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 ....cooocovveeuiiiviccvcmerrrerers e o $70318
Total Amount Due this PEriod.. .o veeereerereemeereceseeeeeeeeseene. ' o $24,279.18
Previous Balance Due.......cocccovvveeieeveeneinnen, : $20.275.12
Total Amount Due...............ifid i e e $44.554.30

Please Wire Transfer

1efi ' TI.VC(}nsu!ting Canada Inc.
Beneficiary account number: 476960861715

ST Registration No. 8357 18024R10001



, L Invoice Summary
CONSULTING
Mr. Alan Hutchens March 27, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No. 29000548
8281 Yonge Street FTT Job No. 431696.0001
Thoenhill, ON L3T 2C7 : Terms Payment on Presentation
Canada
Current Invoice Period: Charges Posied through March 24, 2013
Name Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop Senior Managing Director $830.00 2.0 $1,660.00
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 13.8 $9,798.00
Peter Taylor Senior Consultant $460.00 21.6 $9,936.00
Ana Arcvalo Administrative Professional $115,00 0.8 $92.00
Total Hours and Fees 38.2 $21,486.00
HST Registration No. $35718024RT0001 $2,793.18
Invoice Total for Current Period $24,279.18

HST Registration No. 835718024 RT000?



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - March 24, 2013

Invoice # 29000548

Date TK# Name Hours Amount  Narrative
03/22113 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 48.00 Updating website.
031913 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00 Preparing draft inveice for peried ending March 17, 2013,
03/20113 14800  Paul Bishop 1.10 $ 913.00 Review of APA and calls re changes thereto
0319113 14800  Paul Bishop 0.90 $ 747.00 Review of APA
Review and edits to Second Report of the Monitor and foilow-up
. calls/discussions with Monitor's fegal counsel re: same. Review of lease-
0322113 14856 Steven Bissell 3.80 $ 2,898.00 related documents re: potential assignment of leases. Meeting with
representative of GoodLife re; ability of assignee t
Review and comments on Monitor's Second Report. Set up of Menitar's bank
| account re: Saie Proceeds. Additional review of Stay Extension cash flow
0372113 14856 Steven Bisselt 5.00 $ 3.550.00 forecast, Review of revised motion materiais and discussions with Monitor's
iegal counsel re: same. Call with
: , Review of executed APA and post-closing cash fiow forecast. Review and
03/20/13 1485 even Bissel . ,840. comments on draft motion materials. Call wi review assumpiions
20/ G St issell 4.00 $ 2,840.00 s on draft moti terials. Call with A&GMM revi Ii
underlying Stay Extension cash flow forecast.
. Conference call with Monitor's legal counsel re; status of APA. Follow-up
03/191 3. 14856  Steven Bisseli 1.00 $ 710.00 review of draft matian materials.
Review and consolidate commenits in respect to draft motion material, review
and hold conference call with respect to the extended cash flow forecast,
032013 18120 Brogan Tayior 3.50 $ 1.610.00 review and consolidate comments in respect to the draft 2nd report of the
monitor
Review disbursement requests, review draft report and consclidate
03721113 15120  Brogan Taylor 2.30 $ 1,088.00 comments, conference calls to discuss draft materiais and update on status of
pending motion filing, review draft arders and correspendence with legal team.
Review draft materials and consofidate comments, correspondence with legal
counsel, various conference calls io discuss motion materials, draft orders
. 0.00 ' ) > oban ' C N
0¥/22/13 151 20 Brogan Taylor 5.00 3 2,300.0 and the monitor's repert, correspondence with interim management in respect
of confirming lease cure am
Various calls, meetings and correspondence with respect to finalizing the APA
0319113 15120 Brogan Taylor 7.30 g 3.358.00 and discuss and coordination of the filing of motion materials, iming of closing
' DA and completing the security review process. Review the initial draft cash flow
forecast extenst
Calis and correspondence with interim management and fegaf counsel in
03/18M13 15120  Brogan Taylor 3.50 3 1,610.00 respect of finalizing the APA, review draft materials in respect of the APA and
initial draft motion materials.
TOTAL 38.20 $ 21,486.00




FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellinglon Strect West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON MSKI1GE

March 31, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000559

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through March 31, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

 Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration No. 8357 18024RT0001
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Invoice Remittance

Mr, Alan Hutchens March 31, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTT Invoice No. 290005359
8281 Yonge Street FTT Job Ne. 4316%6.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through March 31, 2013

CAD ()

PrOTESSIONA]l SOIVICES .coe i i it iiiir e eeete et tee et eeesser et e e s esssbbbbteasssesssesssnnnnnsontaeerrines
FoXPEISES. .o tie ettt e e et e

Total Fees and EXPEnSes......cocoiiiiin ittt e

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

' $14.012.57

Total Amount Due this Period
Previous Balance Due.......ccooeernieieccnes S $44.554.30
Total Amount Due............ : $58,566.87

Please Wire Transfe

Bank Number: 00
Beneficiary; FTI Consulting Canada Inc.

Benéeficiary account number: 476960861715

HIST Registration No. 835718024RF0001
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AL Invoice Summary
CONSULTING

Mr, Alan Hutchens March 31, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTT Invoice No. 29000559
8281 Yonge Street FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms Payment on Presentation
Canada '

Current Invoice Period; Charges Posted through March 31, 2013

Name . Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop : Senior Managing Director $830.00 0.9 $747.00
Steven Bissell : Managing Director $710.00 9.4 $6,674.00
Peter Taylor Senior Consultant $460.00 10.4 $4,784.00
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional $115.00 0.7 $80.50
Linda Kelly Administrative Receptionist $115.00 1.0 $E15.00
Total Hours and Fecs 224 $12,400.50
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $1,612.07
Invoice Total for Current Period $14,012.57

HST Registration No. 8357 18024RT0001



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - March 31, 2013

Invoice # 29000559
Date TK# Name Hours Amount Narrative
03/26/13 15273 Ana Arevalo 0.40 3 46.00  Preparing draft involce for period ending March 24, 2013,
03/27/13 15273 Ana Arevalo 0.30 3 34.50 Finalizing invoice for perfod ending March 24, 2013,
03/26/13 14800 - Paul Bishop 0.90 $ 747.00  Update and calls re distribution
03/3113 14856  Steven Bissell 0.20 $ 142.00  Closing Agenda follow-up call.
t t: t itor’ .
03/25/13 14856  Stoven Blsssl 0.90 3 639.00 Rewew and cpm|men S on Supplen:len al Report to Moniter's Secend Report.
Call with Monitor's legal counsel re: same.
) Review of correspondence with CRA. Calt with Monitor's legal counsei and
03126013 14856  Steven Bissell 280 3 1.988.00 email cofrespondence re: same. Rewem.f of Ieas_e ezsss'gnment anq a.ssumptlon
status and related cure amounts. Call with Monitor's counsel re: timing of
distributions and expiry of appeal
03127113 14856 . Steven Bissol 4.50 $ 2,195.00 P.rep'aralt:on for, and attendance in Court re: assignment and vesting order and
distribution arder,
03/28/13 14856  Steven Bissel 1.00 3 710.00 Call with various legal and fm.an::EaI advisors re: closing mechanics, Follow-up
and correspondence re: receipt of procesds.
03/25/13 18441  Linda Kelly . 0.20 % 23.00 Upleading documents to website
03/26/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.20 $ 23.00  Uploading documents o website,
03/2713 18441  Linda Kelly 0.60 $ 62.00  Upleading documents to the website.
03/25113 15120 Brogan Taylor 420 3 552.00 Review draft s.uppti.amental report of the Monitor, draft website update
language, review disbursemernts.
Review correspondence from legal counse! and high levet review of security
review documents, coordinate posting of Monitor's supplemental report to
Tayl .00 300.0 . ) e e . . )
03/26/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 5 $ 2 0 webslhe, review draft distribution analysis to NBC, review professional fees
previded by Golub, review regu
08/37/13 15120 . Brogan Taylor 100 $ 450.00 Atlencli colrt hearing re: Approval and Vesting Order and Ancillary Order,
- coordinate updates to website,
Cinsing mechanics calls with legat counse! and all other professionals
03/28/13 15120 ° Brogan Taylor 3.00 §  1,380.00 involved, correspondence with Scotia Bank re: receipt of proceeds, numercus
. correspondences in respect of closing logistics.
03/31/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 0.20 $ 92.00 Closing Mechanics Cail

TOTAL 22.40 $ 12,400.50
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CONMNSULTING

FTT Consulting Canada Inc.

1D Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington Street West

Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON M5K1G8

April 16,2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000571

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through April 7, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

s

i Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HS'T Registration No. 835718024RT0001




Mr. Alan [futchens
Extreme Fitness; Inc,
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7

Invoice Remittance

April 16, 2013

FTI Invoice No. 29000571

FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Terms: Payment on Presentation

Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through April 7, 2013

C4D (3)
Professional Services.......... R TSRO O TP
LT T O O
Total Fees and EXPenses......c i e sereses s senns
HST Registration No. 835718024RT000] ...ccoocerereerserseeres - $1.150.96
Total Amount Dute this PEriod........o....ooooooooerooeeeos oo siibibisye oo 7 $10,004.47
Previous Balance DUE. .........coccovuvveerierrneonrnenss i $14,012.57
Total Amount Due......... - oo BT e $24,017.04

Please Wire Transf

Scotia Plaza,

‘oronto; ON

® gl
0

EIST Registration No. 835718024RT0001
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CONSULTING

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through Aprit 7, 2013

Invoice Summary

April 16,2013

FTTI Invoice No. 29000571

FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop Senior Managing Director $830.00 1.3 $1,079.00
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 8.3 $5,893.00
Peter Taylor Director $525.00 3.2 $1,680.00
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional £115.00 0.7 $80.50
Linda Kelly Administrative Receptionist $115.00 0.3 $34.50
Total Hours and Fees 13.8 $8,767.00
Mileage $32.40
Transportation $54.11
Total Expenses $86.51
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $1,150.96
Invoice Total for Current Period $10,004.47

HST Registraticn No. 835718024RT0001



Extreme Fifness
431696.0001 - April 7, 2013

Invoice # 29000571

Date TH# Name Hours Amount  Narrative

04/02113 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.30 $ 34.50 Finatizing invoice for period ending March 31, 2013.

04/01413 15273 Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00  Preparing draft invoice for period ending March 31, 2013,

04/0513 14800  Paul Bishop 0.60 $ 498,00 Status update

04/04113 14800  Paul Bishop 0.70 $ 581.00 Review of closing fee issue
Call with 1SQ, A&M and NBC re: I1SQ Advisory Fee, Follow up with Monitor's

04/05/13 14856  Steven Bissell 1.50 5 1,065.00 legal counsel re: same. Foliow-up and tracking of initiat Advisory Fee wirg

. payment.

Project biling and adminisiration. Review of iSQ engagement jetter and

04/04/13 14856  Steven Bissell 1.50 $ 1,065.00  preparation of estimate of Advisory Fee due on Closing. Cali with G. Karpel, P.
Moore re same, Emall correspendence with 1SQ and NBC.

04/03/13 14856 - Steven Bissell 080 $ 568.00 Cii”! and discussprfs with Monitor's legal cpunsel, co_Unsel to NBC and A&M

) re: amount and timing of payment of certain transaction related fees.
‘ Processing and coordination of distributions to DIP lender and Purchaser, Call

04/02/13 14856  Steven Bissell 2.00 5 1.420.00  with Monitor's legal counsel re: investment banker and email correspondence
with NBC re: same.
Closing-related actions, inctuding preparation of distributions to Applicant and

04/071/13 14856  Steven Bissell 250 $ 1,775.00 DiP Lender. Emaaj.correspondence with NBC legal .counsei re: cWosing. Email
coerrespondence with legal counsel to RIP lender re: DiP payout, Emall
correspondence with Purchaser

04/04/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.10 $ 11.50  Updatling Extreme Fitness Website.

04/02/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.20 % 23.00 Uploading documents to the website.

: Call with 1SQ, A&M, A&B, and TGF in respect of the calculation and payment

04/05M13 15120 © Brogan Taylor 1.50 $ 787.50 of the success fee, review disbursement requests, double check cure
payments to be paid and those made tc date,

04/04/13 15120 Brogan Tayior 0.50 5 962.50 Review disbursement requests, review ISQ's engagement ietter with respect
o the success fee

04/03/13 16120 Brogan Taylor 0.50 $ 262 50 Review disbursement requests, discussions wih legal counsel in respect of
15Q success fee payments.

04/02/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 0.70 $ 967 50 Rew.ew,dtsburs:ement requests, coordinate ypdalt'es fo be posted to the
Monitor's website, responde fo stakeholder inguiries

TOTAL 13.80 $ 8,767.00




FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2018, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON M3K1G8

April 17, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTIJob No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000572

Enclesed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through April 14, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

Steven Bissell
Managing Director

¥

Enclosures

HST Repistration No, 8357 18024RT000T



Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through April 14, 2013

Invoice Remittance

April 17,2013

FTT1 Invoice No. 25000572

FTT Job No. 431696.0001
Terms: Payment on Presentation

PrO eSS ONAl S VICES. .o vt eisiereere e e e ee et eeeeeeeeees et e evasssesessssnteennremenes
EXPEIISES .. ccveiiiriiie sttt see e e re e e b et eas e teer s

Total Fees and Expenses

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0O00T ... v

Total Amount Due this Period

Previous Balance DUE.......ccveeeeeeiveeeeees e,

Total AmountDue..................... .........

[I'Consulting Canada Inc.
ount number: 476960861715

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

CAD (§)

...........  $4.410.00

om0

$10.004.47

$14,987.77




Invoice Summary

Mr. Alan Hutchens April 17,2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No. 29000572
8281 Yonge Street IFTT Job No. 4316%96.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms Payment on Presentation

Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through April 14, 2013

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 3.6 $2,556.00
Peter Taylor Director $525.00 34 $1,785.00
Ana Arevalo Administrati ve Professional $115.00 0.4 $46.00
Linda Kelly Administrativ e Receptionist $115.00 0.2 $23.00
Total Hours and Fees 7.6 $4.410.00
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $573.30
Invoice Total for Current Period $4,983.30

FIST Registration No. 83571 8024RT0001



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - April 14, 2013

Invoice # 29000572
Date TK#  Name Hours Amount  Narrative

04410413 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00 Preparing draft invoice for period ending April 7, 2013,

Emali correspondence and follow up cail with B. Hayes (Golub Capital) re
; payout statement. Discussions with Monitor's legal counse! re same. Review

uanons 14858 Steven Bissel 1.0 $ 923.00 of daily cash flow forecast and support for PCF expense reimbursement
request.

04/09/13 14856  Steven Bissell 0.80 $ 568,00 Update cali with A&M and folow-up discussions with Menitor's legal counsel.

. Review of landiord motion materials. Discussions with Monitor's legal counsel.

04/08/13 14856 Steven Bisseli 1.50 $ 1,065.00 Coordination of payment of Advisory Fee due on Closing.

04/08M13 18441 Linda Kelly .20 $ 23.00 Uploading decuments to the website.

9412113 15120 Brogan Taylor 450 $ 262 50 ResE:o.nde to various enguiries from stakeholders received via the Monitor's

. email inbax,

0411113 15120 + Brogan Taylor 0.30 $ 157.50 Review disbursement requests

Review setlement offer from Danforth location in respect of cure payments,
av 1 b 5 Ca ital §
04/10/3 15120  Brogan Taylor 160§  sdco0 PRI e e riorty
acility.

Conference call with intarim mapagement, follow up call with legal counsal,
discussion in respect D_VEPPA and outstanding {ems with respect

04/09/13 15120 Brogan Tayior 1.00 $ 526.00 to the assignment of the last outstanding real property leases and capital
leasos, review disbursement

TOTAL 7.60 & 4,410.00
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ONBSULTING
I'T1 Consulting Canada Inc,
TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P,O, Box 104
Toronto ON M5K1G8

April 30, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000598

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matier. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through April 30, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,
- T

=1 P
P N O A

£

Steven Bissell
Managing Drirector

Enclosures

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001
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Invoice Remittance

Mr. Alan Hutchens April 30, 2013

Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No. 29000598
8281 Yonge Street . : FT1 Job No. 431696.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through April 30, 2013

cap 3
Pro eSS TOMAL SEIVICES. 1 vttt ettt e et ee e et s eeesteveetee st raen - - 0,60600
EXPENSES .ot v e : $0:00
Total Fges ANA EXPENSES......veiuireircrieeeiireiter ettt re e . L - .
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 ....ooveivviivieiieceeee,

Total Amount Due this Period $11,984.78

Total Amount Due................. i i i . $11.984.78

Please Wire Transfer To:

Bank of Nova Scot
Scotia Plaza,
Toronto,
Swift Coi

HST Registration Ne. 835718024RT0001



Pl Eoi i
FooTo

COMNSULTING

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through April 30, 2013

Invoice Summary

April 30, 2013

FTI Invoice No. 29000598

FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 8.5 $6,035.00
Peter Taylor Director §525.00 8.4 $4,410.00
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professiona) $115.00 1.4 $161.00

Total Hours and Fees

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

Invoice Total for Current Period

18.3 $10,606.00

$1,378.78

$11,984.78

HST Registration No. 835718024RT000!1




Extreme Fithess
431696.0001 - April 30, 2013

invoice # 29000598

Date TK# Name Hours Amount Narrative
04/16/13 15273 Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46,00 Preparing draft invoice for period ending April 14, 2013,
04/17/13 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.30 $ 34,50 Finalizing invoice for period ending April 14, 2013,
04/19/13 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.30 $ 34.50 Updating website.
04/23/13 16273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 46.00  Preparing draft invoice for period ending April 21, 2013,
Monitor's legal counsel invoice to Extreme Fitness. Review of actual vs.
. budget professional fees. Email and phone correspondence with Monitor's
04722113 14856  Steven Bissel 0.80 $ 568.00 legal counsel re: professional fee forecast for Stay Extension. Call from
Extreme gym member and follow-up re:
04/23/13 14856 Steven Rissell 0.50 $ 355.00 Call with M. \INaglne'zr re: stay extension and.other CCAA matiers. Review of A.
Hutchens affidavit in support of stay extension.
04/24/13 14856  Staven Bissell 0.50 $ 355.00 Conference call with A&M re; updates and follow-up next steps.
Email correspondence with A&M re: summary of payments from sale
04/25/13 14856  Staven Bissell 1.00 % 710.00 proceeds. Review and comments on the Third Report of the Monitor. Review
of A&B Danforth Lease settlement agreement.
04/26/13 14856  Steven Bissell 1.00 $ 710.00 Professnonjal fegs foracast. Review of Danforth email correspondence and
‘ conversaticn with M. Wagner re: next steps,
041513 14856 Steven Bissell 050 $ 355.00 Email carrespon.dence with Golub Capital re: PCF. Discussions with Monitor’s
: legal counsei ra: sama.
Review of Notice of Assessment and implications to reccveries. Finalization of
04/16/13 14856  Steven Bissell 170 $ 1207.00 PCF' pa’yout amounts and payment set up for ;ame. Dlslcusspns with .
) Monitor's legal counsel re: status of lease assignment discussions and Notice
of Assessment.
04/18/13 14856  Steven Bissell 0.50 $ 355,00 Review of A. Hutchens affidavit re: Danforth Lease.
04/19/13 14856  Steven Bissell 0.50 $ 355.00 Review of motion materials re: Danforth Lease.
Updates to the Third Report of the Monitor. A&M information requests re:
04/30/13 14856  Steven Bissell 1.50 % 1,065.00 recovery analysis. Review of contract to be disclaimed, correspondence with
Monitor's counsel and signing of notice.
Review Priority Credit Facility pay off amounts and documentation,
04/15/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 1.50 $ 787.50 correspondence with legal counsel, conference calt with Golub re: PCF payoff
and fees
04/16/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 0.80 $ 420.00 Review cash flow Yarlance analysis, 'corresponder\ce in respect of final real
property lease assignments and capital lease assignments.
04/19M13 15120 Brogan Taylor 0.60 $ 315,00 Review motion materials, coordinate posting of materials to website,
Review draft Moniter's third report, review draft cash flow forecast extension,
04/25/13 15120  Bregan Taylor 1.80 $ 945,00 review correspondence between iegal counsel in respect of Danferth location
and the cure payment motion.
Internal update discussion in respect of Danforth location correspondence,
04/26/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 140 $ +35.00 review comments. prgvadgd in respect of draft f:ash flow forecast extensmn,.
conference call with intarim management to discuss draft cash flow extension,
review draft professional f
04/29/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 0.30 $ 157.50 Review professional {fee forecast, correspondence with interfim management
Review revised cash flow forecast extension, review vartance analysis for 8
weaek period since last stay extension order, draft variance analysis section of
0473013 15120 Broga” Taylor 200 $ 1,050.00 Mcniter's 3rd Report, incorporate comments into draft report, create a
summary schedule of the tran
TOTAL 18.30 $§ 10,606.00
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CONBULTING
FTT Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Weilington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON M5K1GS

May 15, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thombhill, ON 1.3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTT Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000602

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through May 12, 2013,

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,
g

4

Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001
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Invoice Remittance

Mr. Alan Hutchens May 15, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No. 29000602
8281 Yonge Street F11 Job No. 431696.0001
Thormnhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation
Canada :

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through May 12, 2013

CAD (%)

Y Lo Toe 0 0 T o a Loy ST
B PEIISES. oot s e e e

Total Fees and Expenses

HST Registration No. 835718024RT000 .......eveveoeerersro oo 892612

Total Amount Due this Period © $8.050.12

Previous Balance Due.........ocoooovv oo $11.984.78

Total AMOUnt DU k. $20,034.90

Please Wire Transfe

: FTI‘Consultlng Canada Inc.
Benef;cmry account number: 476960861715

FIST Registration No. 835718024RT0001



T

_, ‘ Invoice Summary
COMNBULTING

Mr. Alan Hutchens May 15, 2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTT Invoice No. 29000602
8281 Yonge Street FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms Payment on Presentation
Canada

Current Tnvoice Peried: Charges Posted through May 12, 2013

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop . Senior Managing Director $830.00 2.7 $2,241.00
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 2.6 $1,846.00
Peter Taylor Director $525.00 5.5 $2,887.50
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional £115.00 0.7 - $80.50
Linda Kelly Administrative Receptionist $115.00 0.6 $69.00
Total Hours and Fees 12.1 $7,124.00
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $926.12
Invoice Total for Current Period $8,050.12

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0G01



Extreme Fithess
431696.0001 - May 12, 2013

Invoice # 29000602

Date TK# Name Hours Amount  Narrative

05/0113 15273 Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 48.00  Preparing draft invoice for period ending Aprii 30, 2013,

05/02/13 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.3C $ 34,50 Finalizing invoice for period ending April 3G, 2013.

05/06/13 14800 Paul Bishop 1.20 $ 8996.00 Update calls with counsel and with NBC

05/01/13 14800  Paui Bishop 0.80 $ 664.00 Review of costs, call with NBC

05/03/13 14800  Paul Bishop 0.70 3 581.00 Call with grant m prep for same
Finalizing 3rd report of the Monitor. Discussions with P. Bishop re: status of file

05/01/13 14856  Steven Bissell 1.60 $ 710.00 and forecast through July 12th. Review of motion materials re: Danforth
l.andlord negotiations.

05/02/43 14856 Steven Bissell 0.80 $ 568.00 Call w!th Monitor's Iega! counsel re: status of Danforth Landlord negotiations.

- Call with &. Moffat re: same.

Discussion with M. Wagner re: WEPP process and eligible ex-employees.

05/07/13 14856  Steven Bissell .80 $ 568.00 Review of GL offer letters and email correspondence with A&M and Monitor's
counsel re: same.

05/01/13 18441  Linda Kelly 0.30 $ 34.5¢ Posting Extremne Fithess Documents to the website.

05/10/13 18441 Linda Kelly 63§ 34.5C¢ Posting documents to Extrerne Fitness Website.

' Review March 31, 2013 financial statements and Adjustment Amount
05/06/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 1.50 $ 787.50 calgulation provided by Extreme Fitness in respect of Asset Purchase
: Agreement with Goodlife, Discuss intemally.

Review email corespondence between {egal counsel for Extreme and

050713 © 15120 Brogan Taylor 1.00 $ 595.00 Danforth Landlord .|n respect of proposed eitlene

w GoodLife offers of employme niee

05/08/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 0.50 $ 262.50 Corres_pondence with legal counsel in respect of Court hearing to seek stay
extension.
Prepare and aftend Court hearing in respect of stay extension. Review

05/09/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 1.50 $ 787.50 correspondence between legal counsel for Extreme, Goodlife, and Danforth
Landlord in respect of settlement agreement for cure costs.

05/01/13 15120 Brogan Taylor 050  $ 252,50 Coordinate posting of Court materials to Monitor's website, review final draft
Mgcnitor's report

05/02/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 0.50 $ 962,50 Review disclaimer notices, revzew.c:orre'aspondence between legal counsel in
respect of landlord cure payment litigation.

TOTAL 12.10 § 7,124.00




FTT Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronte ON M3K1GR

May 24, 2013 -

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTIJob No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000608

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through May 19, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HS'T Registration No. 835718024RT000!1




CONSULTIN

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thormhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

F T T

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through May 19, 2013

Invoice Remittance

May 24, 2013

FTI Invoice Ne. 29000608
FTIJob No. 431696.0001
Terms: Payment on Presentation

._CAD (5)

PrOfESSTONAl SEIVICES...cvviiiiiceereecrerrertre st eras e e este s bbb s nn e renes e $1,671 50

gL 1 1L O U OO TP A TPTO RS

Total Fees and Expenses

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

Total Amount Due this Period.........

Previous Balance Due.........cccceevinnne

Total Amount Due............

Please Wire Transf

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

50,00

$217.30

$1,888.80

$8.050.12

$9.938.92
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COMBULTING

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through May 19, 2013

Invoice Summary

May 24, 2013

FTT Invoice No. 29000608

FTT Job No. 431696.0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Paul Bishop Senior Managing Director $830.00 0.6 $498.0C
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 0.8 $568.00
Peter Taylor Dircctor $523.00 1.0 $525.00
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional $115.00 0.7 $80.50
Total Hours and Fees 3.1 $1,671.50
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $217.30
Invoice Total for Current Period $1,888.80

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - May 19, 2013

Invoice # 29000608

Date TK# Name Hours Amount  Narrative

05714113 16273 Ana Arevalo G.40 $ 46.00  Preparing draft invoice for peried ending May 12, 2013.

U5/15/13 15273 Ana Arevalo .30 $ 34.50 Finalizing invoice for pericd ending May 12, 2013,

0571513 14800  Paul Bishop 0.60 $ 498.00 Status update

05/13113 14856 Sleven Bissel 0.80 $ 568.00 Review of May 9th Court Order and coordination of wire payment of setdtement
and cure proceeds 10 landiord.

051713 15120 Brogan Taylor 1.00 $ 525.00 Daily revat?w of disbursemenis and cor.respondence wrt'h interim management
team, review update correspondence in respect of assignment of leases

TOTAL 3.10 $ 1,671.50




CONSULTIN

g«m ewwgﬂm . % 1

FT1 Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhouse Tower

7% Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto ON M5K1(G8

May 31, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000621

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through May 31, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter.

Sincerely yours,

oy

skt f % o
it 5 ot A

e
PR (. A

e .
Steven Bissell

Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001
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CONSULTING
Invoice Remittance

Mr. Alan Hutchens May 31,2013
Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No. 29000621
8281 Yonge Street - FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation
Canada ' :

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through May 31, 2013

PrO S ST O A Sl TS ittt ettt ettt e et e e aes
B4 81 4 T P UPRPRTRTPPPRUROTON

Total Fees and B XPENSES. .ciiiiiie it

HST Registration No. 835718024RTO001 ..o :

Total Amount Due this Period $1,270.12

Previous Balance DUe..........oooooooooooooeooo. ' e $1.888.80

Total_Amount | 3 LV U= SOOI i RN | $3.158.92

Please Wire T ransfé To:

neficiary: I:uConsulting Canada Ine.
Beneficiary account number: 476960861715

HST Registration No. 835718024RT000]



Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current Tnvoice Period: Charges Posted through May 31, 2013

Invoice Summary

May 31, 2013

FTT Invoice No. 29000621

FTI Job No. 4316%6.0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 1.1 $781.00
Peter Taylor Director $525.00 0.3 $262.50
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional $115.00 0.7 $80.50
Total Hours and Fees 2.3 $1,124.00
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $146.12
Invoice Total for Current Period $1,270.12

HST Registration No. 833718024RT0001




Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - May 31, 2013

Invoice # 29000621

Date TK# Name Hours Amount Narrative

05/21/13 15273 Ana Arevalo .40 $ 48.00 Preparing draft invoice for periced ending May 19, 2013.

05/24/13 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.30 $ 34.50 Finalizing invoice for period ending May 19, 2013,

05/24/13 14856  Steven Bissell 0.80 $ 568.00 Conferenc_e call with A&M, A&B, Goodmans and Monitor re: response to DOJ
letter. Review and comrents on draft response.

05/28/13 14856  Steven Bissell 0.30 $ 213.00 Review and reconciliation of Monitor's bank staternents.
Correspondence and follow up discussion with legal counsel in respect of

05/23/13 15120  Brogan Taylor 0.50 $ 262,50 status update on Payrnenttech and RBC depusits as well as cormpleting the
outstanding lease assignments.

TOTAL 2.30 $ 1,124.00




) e
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FT1 Censulting Canada Inc,
TD Waterhouse Tower

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.C. Box 104
Torento ON MSK1G8

June 20, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTT Job No. 431696.0001
Invoice # 29000631

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in comnection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through June 16, 2013,

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter,

Sincerely yours,

?MO Setn,7

Paul Bishop
Senior Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registration Ne. 835718024RT0003



Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Current [nvoice Period: Charges Posted through June 16, 2013

Invoice Remittance

June 20, 2013

FTT Invoice No. 29000631

FTT Job No. 431696.0001
Terms: Payment on Presentation

O oo LA T: 1 B o (ot ORI
J25 q LS4 < O U PR

Total Fees and EXPenses.......o.ovv v |
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001

Total Amount Due this Period

Total Amount Due........... '

Please Wire Transfer To:

Bank of Nova Scotla

ST Registralion Ne. 8357 18024RT0001

$331.63

$2,882.63

$2.882.63




CORSULTIN

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extireme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thormhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

o

P

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted‘through June 16, 2013

Invoice Summary

June 20, 2013

FTI Invoice No. 29000631
FTIJob No. 431696.0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Steven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 0.3 $213.00
Peter Taylor Director $525.00 4.3 $2,257.50
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional $115.00 0.7 $80.30
Total Hours and Fees 5.3 $2,551.00
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $331.63
Invoice Total for Current Period $2,882.63

HST Registration No, §35718024RT0C01



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - June 16, 2013

Invoice # 29000631

Date TK# Name Hours Amount Narrative

06/01/13 16273 Ana Arevalo 040 46.00 Preparing draft invoice for period ending May 31, 2013.

06/04/13 16273  Ana Arevalo 0.30 34.50 Finalizing inveice for period ending May 31, 2013.

06/06/13 14856  Steven Bissel 0.30 213.00 Review of letter communication to CRA.
Review Adjustment Amount calcutation and history of correspondence

06/05113 15120 Brogan Taylor 1.00 525,00 bf_ltween Purchase.r and Extremg 5 counseE: particpate an conferenf:e call to
discuss Purchaser's concerns with calcuiation, review refevant sections of the
APA in respect of timeline to reac

06/071153 18120 Brogan Taylor 0.50 262.50 Re.\.'iew gnd respond to Inquiries received via the Monitor's email inbox and
voicemail.

0611013 15120  Brogan Taylor 100 525.00 Return call from u.mity cfompany representative, review correspondence from
tegal counsel, review disbursements.

0611113 15120  Brogan Taylor 0.80 420.00 Review correspondence from legal counsel, review draft agreement with
Paymenttech.
Review disbursements, review correspondence from iegal counsel, return caif

06/14/13 15120 Brogan Taylor -1.00 525.00  from utility company, review APA for detafls in respect of timing of rectification
of Adjustment Amount calculation.

TOTAL 5.30 2,551.00




FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
TD Waterhousc Tower

79 Wellington Sireet West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
‘Toronto ON M3KI1GR

June 30, 2013

Mr. Alan Hutchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7
Canada

Re: FTI Job No. 431696.0001
invoice # 29000642

Enclosed is our invoice for professional services rendered in connection with the above referenced matter. This
invoice covers professional fees and expenses through June 30, 2013.

Please do not hesitate to call me to discuss this invoice or any other matter,

Sincerely yours,

IIIII Steven Bissell
Managing Director

Enclosures

HST Registraticn No. 835718024RT0001




Invoice Remittance

Mr. Alan Hutchens June 30, 2013

Extreme Fitness, Inc. FTI Invoice No. 29000642
8281 Yonge Street , , FT1 Job No. 431696.0001
Thornhill, ON L3T 2C7 Terms: Payment on Presentation
Canada

Current Invoice Period; Charges Posted through June 30, 2013

CAD (8)

PrOTesSIONAl SEIVICES. ccoiie i et ve s e e ettt s e e e s s e e e e e e smne s rearbaeeeeaannreenans
B 0= - FO O O OO PO PO

Total Fees and Expenses $ ,29500

$428.35

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0O001 ....eovoieeceeceeeecnes s

Total Amount Due this Period $3,723.35
Previous Balance Due.........oovevvecveiieciecccnnnns $2.882.63
Total Amount Due............ SOV ST $6.605.98

Please Wire T r_'_qué”

 Scotia

HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001



Mr. Alan Futchens
Extreme Fitness, Inc.
8281 Yonge Street
Thorrhill, ON L3F 2C7
Canada

Current Invoice Period: Charges Posted through June 30, 2013

Invoice Summary

June 30, 2013

FTT Inveice No. 29000642

FTI Job No. 431696.0001
Terms Payment on Presentation

Name Title Rate Hours Total
Stoven Bissell Managing Director $710.00 1.2 $852.00
Peter Taylor Director $525.00 4.5 $2,362.50
Ana Arevalo Administrative Professional $115.00 0.7 $80.50
Total Hours and Fees 6.4 $3,295.00
HST Registration No. 835718024RT0001 $428.35
Invoice Total for Current Period $3,723.35

HST Registration No, 8357 18024RT0001



Extreme Fitness
431696.0001 - June 30, 2013

Invoice # 29000642
Date TK# Name Hours Amount Narrative
06/18/13 15273  Ana Arevalo 0.40 $ 45.00  Preparing draft invoice for peried ending June 16, 2013,
06/20113 15273 Ana Arevalo 0.30 $ 34 50  Finalizing invoice for peried ending June 16, 2013.
t - t’

061813 14856 - Steven Bissell 0.70 $ 49700 Update call with Company, TGF and legal counsel re: next steps and potential
bankruptoy.

06/19/13 14856  Steven Bissel! 0.20 $ 142.00  Confirmation and processing of distributions o GeodLife and 18Q.

06/28M13 14856  Steven Bissell 0.30 $ 213.00 Review of Moniter's Fourth report.
Review draft motion materiais, review draft fee affidavit, begin pulling together

06/2813 15120 Brogan Taytor 1.80 $ 845.00 Monitor's fee information for affidavit, correspondence with legal counsel

. Review correspondence from legal counsel and interim management team in
’ respect of the setllement of the Adjustment Amount. Review APA in respect of

06/17113 16120 Brogan Taylor 100 $ b25.00 timing of the rejease of funds to both pariies. Email correspondence with legal
to confirm understanding o

06813 15120  Brogan Taylor 0.70 $ 367.50 Upd?tfe caEI., and correspendence with Internal team in respect of
administrative prep work te get started.
Correspondence in respect of distribution of Adjustment Amount and

06/19/13 15120 - Bregan Taylor 1.00 $ 525.00 professional fees, set up wire payments and arrange FX transaction in respect
of USD professicnai fees,

TOTAL 6.40 $ 3,295.00




This is Exhibit “B” referred to in the
affidavit of Paul Bishop
sworn before me, this 4%

day of July, 2013.

(4 2=

A CommiSsioner for Taking Affidavits



EXHIBIT “B”

Summary of FT1 Inveices

Invoices dated February 15, 2013 to June 30, 2013

Invoice# ‘Date Fees Expenses HST Total

29000511 2/15/2013 28,887.00 - 3,755.31 32,642.31
29000520 2/24/2013 11,41_3.50 56.20 1,491.06 12,960.76
29000525 2/28/2013 23,187.50 - 3,014.38 26,201.88
29000543 3/21/2013 14,561.50  3,381.08 2,332.54 20,275.12
29000548 3/27/2013 21,486.00 - 2,793.18 24,279.18
29000559 3/31/2013 12,400.50 - 1,612.07 14,012.57
29000571 4/16/2013 8,767.00 86.51 1,150.96 10,004.47
29000572 4/17/2013 4,410.00 - 573.30 4,983.30
29000598 4/30/2013 10,606.00 - 1,378.78 11,984.78
29000602 5/15/2013 7,124.00 - 926.12 8,050.12
29000608 5/24/2013 1,671.50 - 217.30 1,888.80
29000621 5/31/2013 1,124.00 - 146.12 1,270.12
29000631 6/20/2013 2,551.00 - 331.63 2,882.63
29000642 6/30/2013 3,295.00 - 428.35 3,723.35

$151,484.50 $3,523.79 $20,151.10 $175,159.39




This is Exhibit “C” referred to in the
affidavit of Paul Bishop
sworn before me, this 4

day of July, 2013.

Cheor

A Commussiofier for Taking Affidavits




EXHIBIT “C”

Summary of FTI Fees

Services Rendered February 7, 2013 to June 30, 2013

Name Position Hours Avg. Hourly Rate Total

P. Bishop Senior Managing Director 17.60 830.00 14,608.00
S. Bissell Manéging Director 99,60 710.00 70,716.00
P.B. Taylor ~ Director 135.80 474.74 64,470.00
E. Litwin Senior Consultant 0.30 460.00 138.00
A, Arevale  Admin 10.00 115.00 1,150.00
L Kelly Admin 3.50 115.00 402.50

266.80 $151,484.50




IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES® CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. Court File No. CV-13-10000-00CL
C-36. AS AMENDED

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT
OF EXTREME FITNESS, INC.

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
- COMMERCIAL LIST

Proceeding commenced at TORONTO

AFFIDAVIT OF PAUL BISHOP
(Sworn July 4, 2013)

(GOODMANS LLP

Barristers & Solicitors

333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 287

Melaney Wagner (LSUC# 44063B)
Caroline Descours (LSUCH# 58251A)

Tel: 416-979-2211
Fax: 416-979-1234

Lawyers for FTI Consulting Canada Inc.,
as Monitor




Appendix B



Court File No. CV-13-10000-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE
COMMERCIAL LIST

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES CREDITORS’
ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, ¢. C-36, AS AMENDED

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR
ARRANGEMENT OF EXTREME FITNESS, INC.

AFFIDAVIT OF MELANEY J. WAGNER
' (Sworn July 4, 2013)

[, MELANEY J. WAGNER, of the City of Toronto in the Province of Ontario MAKE
OATH AND SAY:

1. I am a Partner with the law firm Goodmans LLP (“Goodmans”), lawyers for FTI
Consulting Canada Inc. (“FTI”), in its capacity as the Court-appointed Monitor (the “Monitor™)
of Extreme Fitness, Inc. in these proceedings (the “CCAA Proceedings™). As such, I have

knowledge of the matters hereinafter deposed to.

2. This Affidavit is made in support of a motion seeking, infer alia, the approval of the fees

and disbursements of the Monitor and its legal counsel during the CCAA Proceedings.

3. Attached hereto éollectively as Exhibit “A” are copies of the accounts rendered by
Goodmans to the Monitor for the period from Januvary 22, 2013 to July 2, 2013, in the total
amount of $288,184.88, including Harmonized Sales Tax (“HST™), in connection with the
CCAA  Proceedings, redacted for confidential information. The estimated fees and
disbursements for Goodmans from July 2, 2013 to the completion of the CCAA Proceedings are
approximately $15,000.

4, Attached hereto as Exhibit “B” is a schedule summarizing each invoice in Exhibit “A”,

including the fees, expenses, HST and total fees charged in each invoice.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit “C” is a schedule summarizing the billing rates and total
amounts billed with respect to each member of Goodmans that rendered services in the CCAA

Proceedings.



-2

6. The hourly billing rates applied in the invoices of Goodmans are Goodmans’ normal
hourly rates. which were in effect from January 22, 2013 to July 2, 2013, and are comparable to
hourly rates charged by Goodmans for services rendered in relation to similar proceedings. To
the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by Goodmans throughout the course of the CCAA
Proceedings are comparable to rates charged by other firms in the Toronto market for the

provision of similar restructuring services.

7. The hours spent on this matter involved dealing with a number of CCAA issues (as more
particularly described in the Monitor’s reports in these CCAA Proceedings) and I believe that the

total hours incurred by Goodmans were reasonable and appropriate 1n the circumstances.

SWORN before me at the City of Toronto,
Ontario, this 4" day of July, 2013.

e

4M/Uw/z N/

A Commissioner for Oaths in and for the ' Melaney J. Wagner
Province of Ontario J



This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the
affidavit of Melaney J. Wagner
sworn before me, this 4%

day of July, 2013.

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits



Barristers & Solicitors

LiP Bay Adelaide Cente
@ , 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

 Direct Line: 416.597.4258
mwagner@goodmans.ca

February 7, 2013

Qur File No.: 13.0251
Via Email

FTT Consulting

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto, ON  M5K 1G8

Attention: Steven Bissell. Managing Divector

Dear Steven:

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the above-noted matter.

I trust you find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not
hesitate 1o contact me.

Yours very truly,

GOODMANS LLP /

A M\r{,{}ﬁ/h& N

Melaney J. Wagner
MIW/ss

Enc.

\6170659



FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
PO Box 104

Toronto, ON

Canada M5K 1G8

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell

Re: Project Lift

Barristers & Salicitors

Bay Adelaide Centra
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

February 7, 2013

OUR FILE NO. 130251

OUR INVOICE NO. 596377
GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

FTCC

TO QUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours
01/22/13 MEW 4.20
01/23/13 MEW 2.00
01/24/13 MEW 40
01/25/13 MEW 1.30
01/27/13 CDS 80
01/27/13 MEW 80
01/28/13 CDS 3.80

Description

Review CCAA court materials and press release and provide comments;
conference call with S. Bissell and P. Bishop re: overview of file; various
discussions with S. Bissell re: CCAA materials and filing matters; conference
call with S. Bissell and S. Graff re: overview of file, timing, pre-filing report;
draft pre-filing report.

Conference call with I. Aversa re: CCAA court materials; status update to S.
Bissell; review administration reserve backup and fee estimates.

Review and speak to S. Bissell re: administration charge and fee estimate.

Speak to S. Bissell re: communications package; message for S, Graff re:
status update; review and provide comments on communications package;
speak to C. Descours re: file overview; speak to S. Graff re: status update;
speak to S. Bissell re: status update.

Reviewing communications package re: CCAA proceedings and
corresponding with M., Wagner re: same.

Revise communications package and circulate to C. Descours for review.

Reviewing and providing comments on motion materials for initial CCAA
application; discussing with M. Wagner re: same.



Date

01/28/13

01/29/13

01/29/13

01/30/13
01/31/13

01/31/13
02/01/13

02/02/13

02/03/13
02/04/13

02/04/13

02/05/13

02/05/13

TKID

MEW

CDS

MEW

MEW
CDS

MEW

MEW

CDS

CDS

CDS

MEW

CDs

WPHO

Hours

4.50

70

1.40

1.00
5.80

.80

.50

2.70

5.80

1.30

2.50

3.80

.30

Barristers & Salicitors

Bay Adelaide Centra
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronta, Ontario MAH 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #596377 -- page 2

Description

Review revised communication package and circulate to S. Bissell; review
CCAA documents and speak to C. Descours re: same; speak to I. Aversa re:
CCAA documents; review S. Bissell comments on CCAA documents.

Reviewing and providing comments on motion materials for initial CCAA
application; discussing with M. Wagner re: same,

Review revised CCAA documents and provide comments to C. Descours;
circulate comments to Aird & Berlis; review Consumer Protection Act;
correspond with S. Graff re: security review; speak to S. Bissell re: CCAA
documents.

Revise pre-filing report; correspond re: security review,

'Reviewing PP SA search results, security documents and related supporting

documents in connection with a security review for Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Speak fo C. Descours re: security review; speak to I. Binnie re: Golub credit
and security documents.

Review Pre-Filing Report; message for S. Bissell and I. Aversa re: status
update.

Reviewing and revising draft pre-filing report; corresponding with M. Wagner
re: same; reviewing security documents and related credit documents and
preparing summary of same.

Reviewing security documents, related credit documents and PPSA search
results, and preparing summary of same.

Reviewing security documents and discussing with M. Wagner re: same;
reviewing revised CCAA materials and revising same.

Review Pre-Filing Report and circulate to S. Bissell; speak to S. Bissell re:
status update; speak to C. Descours re: security review; review revised CCAA
materials; speak to I. Aversa re: status update; speak to S. Bissell re: status
update, CCAA materials; speak to C. Descours re: CCAA materials.

Reviewing and revising draft. CCAA materials; teleconference with M.
Wagner and I, Aversa re: same; reviewing and revising draft pre-filing report;
reviewing DIP Credit Agreement; teleconference with S. Bissell re: same;
teleconference with M. Wagner, 1. Aversa and S. Graff re: same.

Revisions;



Date

02/05/13

02/06/13

02/06/13
02/06/13

TKID Hours

MEW 7.60

CDS 3.40

LIDR 10
MEW 8.10

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Streef, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416,979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #596377 -- page 3

Description

" Review and revise CCAA materials, press release; review S. Bissell

comments on CCAA materials; various discussions with C. Descours and S.
Bissell re: CCAA materials, press release; review Priority Credit Agreement
and correspond re: DIP Credit Agreement; circulate revised CCAA materials
to Aird & Berlis; review newspaper notice; conference call with I. Aversa, C,
Descours re: CCAA materials and status update; review DIP Credit
Agreement; conference call with S. Bissell, B. Taylor and C. Descours re:
DIP Credit Agreement; review further revised CCAA materials and speak to
C. Descours re: same; conference call with S. Graff, I. Aversa and C.
Descours re: DIP Credit Agreement; review revised DIP Credit Agreement
and correspond re: same.

Reviewing revised CCAA materials, notice to creditors, DIP Credit
Agreement and cash flow forecast and corresponding re: revisions to same;
reviewing and revising pre-filing report; finalizing Monitor's consent;
discussing and corresponding with M. Wagner and S. Bissell.

Information about CAIRP publications for Caroline Descours.

Review revised DIP Credit Agreement; various discussions with S. Bissell
and 8. Graff re: DIP; conference call with S. Graff, I. Binnie, M. Flynn, 1.
Aversa, S. Bissell and Golubre: cash flow, DIP Credit Agreement;
conference call with S. Graff, G. Moffat re: DIP Credit Agreement; revised
Pre-Filing Report; speak to C. Descours re: 13-week cash flow; review S.
Graff and S. Bissell comments on Pre-Filing Report and revise per same:
circulate revised Pre-Filing Report; speak to I. Aversa re: status update; speak
to S. Bissell re: status update; review further revised CCAA materials and
provide comments; correspond re: DIP Credit Agreement, cash flows.

OUR FEE

TKID
MEW
CDS
LIDR
WPHO

NAME

Wagner, Melaney
Descours, Caroline
Rooke, Diane
Ostapuk, Helen

$40,597.00

HOURS RATE TOTAL
35.10 hrs $775.00 $27,202.50
28.10 hrs $475.00 $13,347.50
0.10 hrs $260.00 $26.00
0.30 hrs $70.00 $21.00

$40,597.00



Bartisters & Soficitors

Bay Adslaide Centre
333 Bay Strest, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 287

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #596377 -- page 4

DISBURSEMENTS
Copies | 11875
Conference Calls 6.05
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $124.80
TOTAL FEES ON TH]S INVOICE | $40,597.00
HST ON FEES | 5,277.61
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 124.80
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $124.80
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 16.22
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $46,015.63
Retainer to be paid in accordance with our Engagement Letter $50,000.00

TOTAL $96,015.63



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronig, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234 -
goodmans.ca

Invoice #596377 -~ page 5

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS ]’_:LP

] /i \s Jl @/\,ﬂ/(]\‘ \/.W%,

E. & O.E.
MEW /

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged af the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario MoH 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.597.4258
mwagner@geodmans.ca

February 26, 2013

Our File No.: 13.0251
Via Email

FTI Consulting

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto, ON  MA5K 1G8

Attention: Steven Bissell. Managing Director

Dear Steven;

Re: Exireme Fitness, Inc.

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the above-noted matter.

I trust you find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not
hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

MIW/ss

Enc.

V60170650



FTTI Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
PO Box 104
Toronto, ON

Canada M5K 1G8

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario MEH 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416,979.1234
goodmans.ca

February 25, 2013

OUR FILE NO. FTCC 130251

OUR INVOICE NO. 596936
GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Pate

02/07/13

02/67/13
02/07/13

02/08/13

02/08/13

02/11/13

"TKID

CDS

JLE
MEW

CDS

MEW

MEW

Hours

3.50

1.20
5.10

1.10

1.70

30

Description

Reviewing draft factum and corresponding re: comments on same; reviewing
revised CCAA materials; finalizing pre-filing report and serving and filing
same; status update call; attending hearing for Initial Order via
teleconference; follow-up teleconference re: next steps.

Meeting with C.Descours; delivering pre-filing report to court and filing,

Review revised CCAA materials; conference call with Aird & Berlis, Blakes,
TGF, FT1, Alvarez and C. Descours re: status of documents; revise and
finalize Pre-Filing Report; correspond re: Pre-Filing Report; prepare for and
attend hearing on Initial CCAA Application telephonically; review
correspondence re: communication strategy, stay order, continvation of
hearing.

Attending heartug re: Initial Order via teleconference; discussing and
corresponding with 1. Aversa, Aird & Berlis re: notice of proceedings to
additional parties; reviewing Initial Order re: employee claim matters and
corresponding with M. Wagner and S. Bissell re: same.

Prepare for and attend continunance of hearing for Initial CCAA Order;
correspond re: communication strategy, Ministry of Labour questions.

Speak to C. Descours and S. Bissell re: status update.



Date

02/14/13
02/14/13

02/15/13

02/15/13

02/15/13
02/16/13

02/19/13

02/19/13

02/19/13

02/20/13

02/20/13

02/21/13

TKID

CDS
DEF

CDS

DEF

MEW
CDS

CDS

DEF

MEW

CDS

MEW

CDS

Hours

330
.60

2.80

2.50

20
.80

40

2.00

1.60

4.90

3.80

3.50

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaids Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Tororte, Ontario MAH 257

Telephone: 416.979.7211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #596936 -- page 2

Description

Reviewing security documents and related materials for security review.

E-mail correspondence and instructions from Caroline Descours; Search
corporate history, including: conduct on-line search for information on public
record; arrange for Alberta searches

Reviewing security documents and related agreements in connection with
preparing a security review.

Receipt and review Personal Property Security Act (Ontario and Alberta);
Insolvency Act, Bankruptey Manual, Litigation, Section 427 Bank Act; and
Execution searches; begin to summarize searches )

Speak to 5. Bissell re: status update.

Reviewing draft motion materials re: stay extension and KERP approval and
corresponding with M. Wagner re: same.

Reviewing draft retention agreement; incorporating comiments on, draft
affidavit re: stay extension and KERP approval and corresponding with M.
Wagner re: same.

Receipt and review Thornhill Litigation and Bulk Sales searches; proof read
summary and report the results thereon

Conference ¢ i issell and S. Graff re: unsolicited potential bid,;
Teview letter t d speak to S. Bissell re; same; review S. Graff
comments on letter; review correspondence re: KERP; review KERP
documents.

Reviewing and revising draft asset purchase agreement, KERP and stay
extension and KERP approval motion materials; discussing with M. Wagner
re: same; teleconference with S. Bissell and M. Wagner re: draft APA;
meeting with M. Wagner re: same; compiling comments on draft APA and
corresponding with I. Aversa re: same.

Review Asset Purchase Agreement; speak to C. Descours re: Asset Purchase
Agreement, KERP documents; conference call with S. Bissell, B. Taylor and
C. Descours re: Asset Purchase Agreement; review FT1 comments on Asset
Purchase Agreement; correspond re: Asset Purchase Agreement, KERP
documents.

Researching re: sale transaction matters and corresponding with M. Wagner
re: same; preparing security review.



Date TKID Hours  Description

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelzide Centre
333 Bay Sirest, Suite 3400
Teronto, Ontario M5H 2587

Telephone: 416.979.7211
Facsimile; 416.979.1234

goodmans.ca

Invoice #596936 -- page 3

02/21/13 DEF 30 E-mail correspondence with C. Descours; receive instructions; arrange for
further Personal Property Security Act searches in Alberta and Ontario

02/21/13 MEW 50 Review etter of intent and correspond re: same; speak to C. Descours
re: research on sale transaction matters.
02/22/13 DEF 1.30  Receipt and review PPSA searches; surnimarize searches and circulate to C.
Descours
OUR FEE $21,662.50
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MEW Wagner, Melaney 12.60 hrs $775.00 $9,765.00
CDS Descours, Caroline 20,30 hrs $475.00 $9,642.50
DEF Ferreira, Diane 6.70 hrs $290.00 $1,943.00
JLE LaBine, Jackie 1.20 hrs $260.00 $312.00
$21,662.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Searches - Corporate/Lien - Disbursement(s) 199.00

Wire Charges 10.00

Searches - Corporate/Lien - Fee(s) 465.00

Copies 197.50

Search - EDD 334.68

Meals 11.63

Search - Corporate 18.00

Search - PPSA 36.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $1,271.81
TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $21,662.50

HST ON FEES

2,816.13



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.7211
Facsimile: 416,979,1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #596936 -- page 4

NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS (.00

TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 1271.81
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $1,271.81
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 165.34
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $25,915.78
TRUST FUNDS $50,000.00

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

f:ﬁ/} Lﬁ@z ///L @/{f f \f ,\///w-«--.. |

E. & O. E. \3

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.

R il



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.597.4258
mwagner@gocdmans.ca

March 13, 2013
Our File No.: 13.0251
Via Email
. FTT Consulting
79 Wellington Street West

Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto, ON  M35K 1G8

Attention: Steven Bissell, Managing Director

Dear Steven:

Re: Exireme Fiiness, Inc.

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the above-noted matter.

i trust you find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not
hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

GOODMANS LLP

Mg wasner

Enc.

V6170650



FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Sireet West
PO Box 104
Toronto, ON

Canada M5K 1G§

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc,

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre ‘
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

March 13, 2013

OUR FILE NO. FTCC 130251

OUR INVOICE NO. 598394
GST/AIST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date

02/22/13

02/22/13

02/22/13

02/23/13

02/25/13

02/25/13

02/26/13

02/26/13

TKID

PBR

CDS

MEW

CDS

CDS

MEW

CDS

MEW

Hours

2.20

2.50

.80

2.50

1.80

1.60

3.90

.80

Description

Review chart and registered security and amend chart and forward to C.
Descours.

Preparing security review.

Review unsolicited third party L.OI and speak to S. Bissell re: same; message
for S. Graff re: unsolicited third party, status update of Goodlife; correspond
re: unsolicited third party; speak to C. Descours re: Monitor's Report.

Drafting Monitor's First Report.

Corresponding with M. Wagner re: Monitor's First Report; reviewing and
revising same; reviewing revised motion materials for stay extension motion.

Review and provide comments on Monitor's Report; speak to S. Bissell re:
Report, status update; speak to S. Weisz re: unsolicited Letter of Intent and
reporting on same; speak to S. Graff re: Report, status update; correspond re:
motion materials, Monitor's Report; speak to C. Descours re Monitor's Report.

Reviewing and revising First Report; corresponding with CCAA parties re:
same; serving First Report.

Review FTI comments on Monitor's Report; review revised Monitor's Report
and speak to C. Descours re: same; correspond re: Monitor's Report and



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Gentre
" 333 Bay Street, Suite 2400
. Torosto, Ontario M5H 287

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #598394 -- page 2

Date TKID Hours  Description

service list.
02/27/13 PBR B0  Reviewtitle to York Region properties and summarize leaschold security.

02/27/13 CDS .80 Serving and coordinating filing of First Report; preparing affidavit of service;
corresponding with P. Bremner re: real property searches and reviewing
materials m connection same.

02/27/13 MEW 20 Speak to S. Bissell re:— status update.

02/28/13 PBR .80 Make revisions to title summary chart; telephone call with C. Descours.

02/28/13 CDS .50 Corresponding with I. Aversa re: service list; reviewing real property search
' sumimary and corresponding with P. Bremner re: same,

02/28/13 MEW 20 Speak to S'. Bissell re: N status update.

03/01/13 CDS .50  Preparing confidential supplement to First Report and drafiing sealing order

re: same.

03/01/13 MEW 40 Speakto I Aversa re: status update,-

03/04/13 CDS 2,70  Drafting security review.

03/05/13 PBR A0 Correspondence with C. Descours; amend chart of properties.

03/05/13 CDS .50 Reviewing correspondence to Extreme Fitness from CRA; teleconference

with S. Graff, I. Aversa and M. Wagner re: same.

03/05/13 MEW 1.10 Message for L. Aversa re: status update; speak to S. Bissell re: status update;
correspond re: Asset Purchase Agreement; review correspondence from CRA;
conference call with I. Aversa, S. Graff and C. Descours re: status update,
CRA matters.

03/07/13 MEW 2.10  Prepare for and attend motion re: stay extension hearing; correspond with S.
Bissell re: status update; speak to C. Descours re: security review; conference
call with S. Graff and D. Winters re: background/sale matters.

03/08/13 CDS 4,50  Reviewing revised APA; teleconference with M. Wagner, S. Bissell and B.
Taylor re: same; providing comments on APA to 1. Aversa; drafting Monitor's
~ Second Report re: sale approval motion.

03/08/13 MEW 2.00  Review Asset Purchase Agreement; review FTI comments on Asset Purchase
Agreement; conference call with C. Descours, S. Bissell, B. Taylor re: Asset
Purchase Agreement; speak to C. Descours re: Asset Purchase Agreement.



Date TKID Hours

03/09/13 CDS 1.30

Barristers & Selicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Streef, Suite 3400
Toronta, Ontarie M5H 257

Telephona: 416.979.2211
. Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans,ca

Invoice #598394 -- page 3

Description

Drafting security review.
03/11/13 CDS 230  Drafting Monitor's Second Report re: sale approval motion; drafiing security
review.
03/11/13 MEW 40 Review Monifor's Report re: sale approval,
03/12/13 CDS 7.80  Reviewing revised APA; discussing with M. Wagner re: same; teleconference
with S. Graff, J. Desjardins, and M. Wagner re: same; revising Monitor's
Second Report; drafting security review and meeting with M. Wagner re:
same.
03/12/13 MEW 530  Review and provide comments on Golub security review; speak to L.
Mantello re: secugidy review matters; speak to C. Descours re: security
review; speak tw sale transaction update; review revised Asset
Purchase Agreement and correspondence re: same; conference call with S.
Graff, J. Dejardins and C. Descours re: Asset Purchase Agreement.
OUR FEE $28,342.00
TEID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MEW Wagner, Melaney 14.90 hrs $775.00 $11,547.50
CDS Descours, Caroline 31.60 hrs $475.00 $15,010.00
PBRR Bremner, Peggy 4.30 hrs $415.00 $1,784.50
$28,342.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 225.75
Delivery - Courier 173.58
Search - PPSA 216.00
Search - Sub 929.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $1,544.33



Barristers & Soficitors

Bay Adelaide Ceatre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416,979.1234
gondmans.ca

Invoice #598394 -~ page 4

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $28,342.00
HST ON FEES ' 3,684.46
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 1,544.33
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $1,544.33
HST ON TAXABIE DISBURSEMENT 200.76
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $33,771.55
TRUST FUNDS $50,000.00

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN

GOODMANS LLP
! / ] -
%LWO}E' \)

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Seficitors Act {Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Cantre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 287

Tetephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.597.4258
mwagner@goodmans.ca

April 4, 2013

Our File No.: 13.0251
Via FEmail

FTI Consulting

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O.-Box 104
Toronto, ON  MSK 1G8

Attention: Steven Bissell, Managing Director

Dear Steven:

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect io the above-noted matter.

1 trust vou find the enclosed to be in order. If vou have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not
hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

elane} J. Wagner
MIW/ss

Enc.

V6170650



FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
PO Box 104
Toronto, ON

Canada M5K 1GS§

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

April 4, 2013

OUR FILE NO. FTCC 130251

OUR INVOICE NO. 600442
GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date

03/13/13

03/13/13

03/13/13
03/14/13

03/14/13

03/15/13

03/15/13
03/18/13

TKID

CDS

MEW

CDS
MEW

CDS

MEW
CDS

Hours

10.10

.80

50
4.30

1.30

3.40

20
9.20

Description

Drafting security review; discussing with M. Wagner re: same; update call
with M. Wagner and B. Taylor re: progress re: sale transaction and related
motion.

Speak to B. Taylor and C. Descours re: status update; speak to C. Descours re:
Alberta security review.

Reviewing draft security review opinion and meeting with C. Descours.

Drafting security review; discussing with M. Wagner re: same; update call
with M. Wagner and B. Taylor . ‘

Provide status update to B. Taylor and C. Descours; review security review
and provide comments to C. Descours; speak to L. Mantella re: Alberta agent.

Drafting security review; teleconference with H. Zechel (Alberta agent) re:
same; teleconferences with B. Taylor re: updates re: sale transaction;
teleconferences with J. Desjardins re: updates re: sale transaction;
corresponding with M. Wagner re: same,

Correspond re: Alberta agent for security review.

Drafting security review and corresponding and discussing with Alberta agent
re: same; reviewing revised APA and discussing and corresponding with M.



Date

03/18/13

03/19/13

03/19/13

03/20/13

03/20/13

03/21/13

03/21/13

TKID

MEW

CDS

MEW

CDS

MEW

CDS

MOL

Hours

170

12.60

2.10

7.70

2.10

12.40

40

ILp

Invoice #600442 -- page 2
Description

Wagner, S. Bissell, B. Taylor, and J. Desjardins re: same; reviewing draft
motion materials and preparing comments re: same,

Correspond re: APA, security review maﬁers!hiquiﬂes, lease

assignment inatters, motion materials, sale otder, ancillary order, timing of
service and motion; speak to C. Descours re: motions, timing and materials.

Reviewing draft motion materials and preparing comments re: same;
teleconferences with M. Wagner, S. Bissell, B. Taylor, S. Graff, J. Desjardins,
A. Hutchens and G. Karpel re: APA, sale approval motion and related
matters; corresponding re: same; teleconference with M. Flynn re: security
review and distribution of proceeds; corresponding re: saine; drafting Second
Report and corresponding with M. Wagner, S. Bissell, B. Taylor re: same;
drafting security review and corresponding and discussing with Alberta agent
re: same. '

Correspond re: motions, timing and materials, security review matters, APA
matters, distribution matters, sale process matters, third party expression of
interest, status update; various discussions with C. Descours re: motion
materials, timing of same, security review matters and status update.

Drafting security review; corresponding and discussing with Alberta agent re:
same; teleconferences with S. Graff, 1. Aversa, S. Bissell, M. Wagner re: sale
approval motion and related matters; compiling comments on draft motion
materials and corresponding with S. Graff, I. Aversa and J. Desjardins re:
same.

* Correspond re: lease assignment motion, distribution/security review matters,

APA matters; review security review excerpts, motion materials; speak to C.
Descours re: status update, fee estimate motion materials.

Drafting security review; reviewing Alberta security review; teleconference
and corresponding with Alberta agent re: same; preparing sealing order for
confidential supplement; drafting supplemental report; teleconferences and
corresponding with I. Aversa re: sale approval and ancillary motions;
teleconference with M. Wagner re: same; reviewing lease agreements in
connection with assignment of same to GoodLife under section 11.3 of the
CCAA; reviewing revised draft orders and providing comments re: same; .
corresponding with A. Mitchell, I. Aversa and M. Wagner re: same; revising
draft Monitor's Report.

Review of security review.



Date

03/21/13

03/21/713

03/22/13

03/22/13
03/22/13

03/23/13

03/23/13
03/24/13
03/25/13

03/25/13

03/25/13

TKID

MEW

DWG

CDS

MOL
MEW

CDS

MEW
MEW
PBR

CDS

Hours

2.20

2.70

10.60

1.80
1.50

5.50

A0
5.50
2.60

16.20

1.90

Invoice #600442 -~ page 3

Description

Correspond re: motion materials, security review matiers, lease assignments;
review Monitor's Report excerpts; speak to C. Descours re: ancillary order
and status update,

Reviewing lease agreements for C. Descours re: consent for assignment of
lease.

Meeting with S. Bissell and P. Sorrell, GoodLife, to review GoodLife's
financial statements; reviewing and reviging draft motion materials and draft
order; teleconferences and corresponding with S. Bissell and B. Taylor re:
same; corresponding with S. Bissell re: assignment of leases to GoodLife;
corresponding and teleconference with I. Aversa re: same; reviewing,
revising, finalizing and serving Monitor's Second Report; teleconference with
L. Mantello re: security review.

Review of draft security review.

Correspond re: Monitor's Report, security review matiers, APA matters,
motion materials, assignment of leases and cure amounts; review excerpts
from security review and ancillary order re: distribution.

Drafting supplemental report; revising security reviews; revising draft
Ancillary Order and corresponding with I. Aversa re: same; preparing
confidential supplement.

Correspond re: motion materials; review excerpts of ancillary order.
Review and revise security reviews and provide comments to C. Descours.

Telephone call with C. Descours and M. Wagner; commencing review of
titles to 13 properties for information re: ownership and security registered
against freehold property interest.

Reviewing and revising security reviews; meeting with M. Wagner to discuss
same; teleconferences and corresponding with Alberta agent re: same;
teleconferences with I. Aversa, M. Flynn and I. Binnie re: satne; reviewing
and revising Supplemental Report; teleconferences with S, Bissell re: same;
reviewing draft Ancillary Order and Factum and providing comments re:
same; finalizing and serving Supplemental Report.

Tnitial discussions with M. Wagner with respect to real properr-

ecurity review; provide to her draft opinion
qualiications; subsequent telephone discussions with her re: same; receipt of
draft langnage from her; discuss ualifications,




LILP

Invoice #600442 -- page 4
Date TKID Hours  Description

assumptions and limitations; provide to her further opinion language setting
out same; subsequent telephone calls from M. Wagner re: proposed language;
follow up call from her; discussions with her re: same; review qualifications.

03/25/13 MEW 15.80  Review and revise security reviews; various discussions C. Descours, S.
Zimmerman, K. Herlin and C. Costa re: security reviews; review of comments
on ancillary order, factum and supplementary report; correspond re: secutity
reviews, motion materials; conference call with C. Descours, [. Binnie, M.
Flynn re: security review; speak to I. Aversa re: security review,
supplementary report, update 11.3 motion; conference call with C. Descours
and S. Bissell re: security review, supplementary report; update on 11.3
motion; speak to R. Jaipargas re: assignment of Thomhill/Wellington leases;
conference call with S. Bissell and C. Descours re: supplementary report and
security reviews; finalize security reviews and supplementary report.

03/25/13 SZ 50 Meeting with M. Wagner to discuss priorities questions and to review and
comment on draft opinion.

03/26/13 PBR 4.60  Reviewing titles to all of the properties and listing security and leases granted
by Owners; including reviewing documents to determine content where notes
on title PINS were not descriptive.

03/26/13 CDS 5.60  Serving and filing Supplemental Report; compiling security reviews and
delivering copy to S. Bissell; reviewing correspondence re: motion materials,
revised drafts of Orders, assignment of leases and distribution of proceeds;
reviewing and revising CRA Comfort Letter and reviewing correspondence
re: same; teleconferences with I. Aversa and S. Bissell re: distribution of
proceeds; drafting reimbursement agreements and discussing with M. Wagner
re: same.

03/26/13 MEW 11.60  Prepare for court re: Approval and Vesting Order, Ancillary Order; review
revised Ancillary Order, Approval and Vesting Order; correspond with D.
Winters re: Ancillary Order; correspond with S. Bissell re: Ancillary Order;
correspond re: National Bank/Golub payment statements, interim distribution;
speak to S. Bissell re: interim distributions; various discussions with I. Binnie
and M. Flynn re: interim distributions, reimbursement agreement; speak to L.
Aversa re: assignment of leases, orders, status update; review and provide
comments on reimbursement agreement.

03/27/13 CDS 4.50  Preparing materials for motion for Approval and Vesting Order and Ancillary
Order; revising reimbursement agreements; attending motion for Approval
and Vesting Order and Ancillary Order.



Date TKID

03/27/13 MEW

03/28/13 CDS

03/28/13 MEW

03/30/13 MEW
03/31/13 CDS

03/31/13 MEW

04/01/13 MEW

04/02/13 CDS

04/02/13 MEW

Hours

4.80

430

3.50

40
40

1.20

50

40

1.80

Invoice #600442 -- page 5

Description

Speak to R. Jaipargas re: landlord assignment; prepare for and attend court re:
Approval and Vesting Order, Ancillary Order; various discussions with 1.
Aversa, A. Mitchell, G. Moffat, M. Gertner, S. Graff re; lease assignment
matters; discussions with M. Flynn, G. Moffat and 8. Bissell re: interim
distributions; message for I. Aversa re: landlord assignments.

" Reviewing closing agenda and closing documents; revising closing agenda

and corresponding re: same; drafting vendor's and purchaser's certificates and
corresponding re: same; teleconference with Aird & Berlis, Alvarez & Marsal
and FTI re: closing mechanics; corresponding re: closing matters.

Correspond re: closing matters, flow of fund matters, equipment lease
matters; speak to A. Mitchell re: closing matters; review Monitor's Certificate
and Extreme/Good Life certificates; speak to C. Descours re: same;
conference call with . Aversa, K. Wentzel, A. Hutchens, G. Karpel, S.
Bissell, B. Taylor and C. Descours re: closing matters; correspond re: DIP
distribution, interim distribution.

Correspond with S. Graffre: interim distribution.

Teleconference re: final closing mechanics and reviewing correspondence re:
same.

Conference call with S. Ross, H. Berg, A. Mitchell, A. Hutchens, 1. Aversa,
K. Wentzel, S. Graff, S. Bissell, B. Taylor and C. Descours re: closing
matters; correspond re; closing matters; deliver Monitor's Certificate by PDF.

Correspond re: DIP payment, interest on deposit, employee correspondence,
landlord consents.

Reviewing DIP Credit Agreement re: obligations re: payment of legal fees
and corresponding with M. Wagner re: same; reviewing correspondence re:
proceeds analysis; arranging for filing of Monitor's Certlﬁcate with the Court
and circulating copy of same.

Correspond re: DIP payment, fees, landlord consents, Integrity Square success
fee; conference call with S. Bissell and B. Taylor re: Integrity Square success
fee, vacation pay; speak to I. Aversa re: Integrity Square success fee and
speak to S. Bissell re: same.

OUR FEL

$103,294.50



Invoice #600442 -~ page 6

TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MEW Wagner, Melaney 57.40 hrs $775.00 $44,485.00
KEH Herlin, Ken 1.90 hrs $835.00 $1,586.50
MOL Mantello, Lisa 2.20 hrs $685.00 $1,507.00
SZ. Zimmerman, Susan 1.00 hrs $875.00 $875.00
CDS Descours, Caroline 107.20 hrs $475.00 $50,920.00
PBR Bremner, Peggy 7.20 hrs $415.00 $2,988.00
DWG Wakeling, Daniel 2.70 hrs $260.00 $702.00
DA Clerk, Litigation 3.30 hrs $70.00 $231.00
$103,294.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Telephone - Long Distance 8.94

Copies 697.00

Meals 22.17

Conference Calls 10.75

Delivery - Courier 10.00

Search - Sub 156.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $904.80
TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $103,294.50
HST ON FEES 13,428.29

NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 904.86

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $904.86
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMEN'Y 117.63
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $117,745.28




LLP

Invoice #600442 -- page 7

TRUST FUNDS , $50,000.00

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

/KA/\U/Q@/UM\ ‘\\/ ‘

E.&O.E,
MEW /

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicifors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronte, Ontarie M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
gocdmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.597 4258
mwagner@goodmans.ca

April 22, 2013

Our File No.: 13.0251
Via Email

FT1 Consulting

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto, ON  M5K 1G8

Attention: Steven Bissell, Managing Director

Dear Steven:

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the above-noted matter. We also
enclose a copy of the invoice from FMC Law related to the Alberta security review, which is included as a
disbursement on our invoice. '

I trust you find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions fegarding the enclosed, please do not
hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

GO ODMANS LLP

Melaney] WSI:/\/(/\/\/ \/’\/
MIW/ss

Enc,

6170650



FTT Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
PO Box 104
Toronto, ON

Canada MS35K 1G8

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Strest, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M&H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

April 22, 2013

OUR FILE NO. FICC 130251

OUR INVOICE NO. 601237
GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date

04/03/13

04/04/13
04/05/13

04/05/13
04/08/13

04/09/13

04/10/13

04/10/13

TKID

MEW

MEW
CDS

MEW
MEW

MEW

CDS

MEW

Howrs

1.50

20
.50

.20
.90

50

2.30

1.80

sy e reviow Integrity Square engagement lettery .
speak to G. Moffat re: same; correspond with's. Bissell re:
tegrity Square.

Description

ol

Various discussions and correspondence with S. Bissell re:

Correspond re: Integrity Square.

Reviewing motion record of 1079268 Ontario Inc., landlord at the Danforth
property.

Correspond re: update on discussions with Integrity Square and G. Moffat.

Correspond re: equipment lessor/landlord consents; review motion record
from the landlord re: alleged arrears and speak to S. Bissell re: same.

Correspond re: equipment lessor/landlord consents and status of same; speak
to S. Bissell re: status update on landlord motion/ offer to settle, CRA audit.

Meeting with M. Wagner to discuss CRA. claim re: certain potential employee -
related deductions; teleconference with Aird & Berlis re: same; researching
and corresponding with M. Wagner re: same.

Speak to C. Descours re: status update, landlord motion/offer to settle, CRA
audit; conference call with 1. Aversa, S. Graff and C. Descours re: same;




Date TKID Hours

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centra
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.978.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #601237 -- page 2

Description

LDescours re: researct
f speak to S. Bissell re: Golub fees

update to S. Bissell: spe

and message for M., Flynnre: same.

04/11/13 MEW 40 Correspond re: consents, Golub payment statement.
04/12/13 MEW 50 Correspond re: congents.
04/15/13 MEW 60  Speakto S. Bissell re: interim distribution, status update; message for I.
Aversa re; status update on landlord motion/CRA audit; speak to M. Flynn re:
fees and payout statement; update to S. Bissell; correspond re: CRA audit.
04/16/13 MEW 1.50  Review CRA notices of assessment and speak to I. Aversa and S. Bissell re:
same; speak to I, Aversa and S. Bissell re: Danforth lease matter; message for
G. Moffat; speak to G. Moffat re: Danforth lease, CRA notices of assesement.
04/17/13 MEW 20 Correspond re: Danforth responding materials.
04/18/13 MEW 50  Review affidavit re: Danforth responding material; speak to S. Bissell and C.
Descours re: affidavit and correspond re: same.
OUR FEE $8,227.00
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MEW Wagner, Melaney 8.80 hrs $775.00 $6,820.00
CDS Descours, Caroline 2,80 hrs $475.00 $1,330.00
DA Clerk, Litigation 1.10 hrs $70.00 $77.00
$8,227.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Meals 52.63
Conference Calls 69.15
Delivery - Courier 326.08
Agent Fees 5,482.67
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $6,430.53




Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suits 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 287

Telephone: 416.579.2211
Facsimile: 416.579.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #601237 -- page 3

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $8,227.00
HST ON FEES 1,069.51
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT'S 6,430.53
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $6,430.53
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 835.97
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $16,563.01
TRUST FUNDS $50,000.00

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN

\/t\/; & ﬂ/M T \/ ~

E. &0O.E
MEW /

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Selicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



Rarristers & Soliciors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario MOH 287

¢ . Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.597 4258
mwagner@gocdmans.ca

May 27,2013

Our File Ne.:. 13.0251

Via Email

FTI Consulting

79 Wellington Street West

Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
“Toronto, ON  M5K 1G8

Attention: Steven Bissell, Managing Director

Dear Steven:

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect w0 the above-neted matter.

1 trust you find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not
hesitate to contact me,

Yours very truly,
G?O MANS LLP
i

o A’I LD/@DL//Lﬂ(\ ’”‘“/

elaney J. Wagner
MIW/ss

-Enc.

\0170650



FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
PO Box 104
Toronto, ON

Canada MSK 1G8

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Cenire
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Torenio, Ontario Mbh 257

Telephone: 415.979.2211
Facsimile: £16.979.1234
goodmans.ca

May 23, 2013

OUR FILE NO. FTCC 130251

OUR INVOICE NO. 6032385
GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date

04/19/13

04/22/13
04/22/13
04/23/13

04/23/13
04/24/13
04/24/13

04/25/13

TKID

MEW

CDS
MEW
CDS

MEW

CDS

MEW

CDS

Hours

70

2.00
.80
2.00

1.20

1.30

1.30

50

Description

Review Goodlife responding materials; correspond re: Small Claims Court
matter, update on lessor consents.

Drafting Monitor's Third Report.
Correspond re: stay extension, fee forecast; prepare fee forecast.

Reviewing draft motion materials and providing comments re: same; drafting
Monitor's Third Report. -

Correspond with I. Aversa re: stay extension; speak to C. Descours re:
Monitor's Report; correspond with I. Aversa re: status update and provide
status update to S. Bissell.

Revising Monitor's Third Report and corresponding with M. Wagner and S.
Bissell re: same; reviewing correspondence re: Danforth lease matter and
related settlement proposal.

Review and provide comments on Monitor's Report re: stay exiension; review
correspondence re: Danforth motion/offer to settle; correspond re:
lessor/landlord consents.

Revising Monitor's Third Report; reviewing correspondence re: motion re:
Danforth lease dispute.



Date

04/25/13

04/26/13

04/26/13

04/30/13

04/30/13
05/01/13

05/01/13

05/02/13
05/02/13

05/03/13
05/06/13

05/06/13

05/07/13

05/08/13

TKID

MEW

CDS

MEW

CDS

MEW
CDS

MEW

CDS
MEW

MEW
CDS

MEW
MEW

CDS

Hours

70

.80

1.50

80

40
2.00

1.40

30
1.00

50
20

1.00

.80

40

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Cntario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.975.2211
Facsimile: 416.975.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #603285 -- page 2

Description

Review S. Bissell comments on report and correspond re: same; correspond
re: Danforth lease, survey of premises.

Reviewing draft motion materials re: stay extension motion; corresponding
with I, Aversa re: comuments re: motion materials; revising draft Third Report;
discussing with M. Wagner re: same and corresponding with [. Aversa re:
same.

Speak to [. Aversa re: Danforth lease matters, strategy and next steps;
conference call with S. Ross, A. Mitchell, K. Sherkin, M. Gertner, S. Graff, [.
Aversa re: Danforth lease matters.

Revising third report and corresponding with S. Bissell, B. Taylor and M.
Wagner re: same; reviewing notice of disclaimer of Xerox lease agreements;
teleconference with M. Wagner re: same; teleconference with [. Aversa re:
same, corresponding with M. Wagner, S. Bissell, B. Taylor, I. Aversa and J.
DesJardins re: same.

Correspond re: Zerox naotice of disclaimer and speak to C, Descours re: same.

Reviewing reply motion materials and related correspondence re: dispute re:
Danforth lease; finalizing and serving Monitor's Third Report; corresponding
with S. Bissell, B. Taylor and M. Wagner re: same; preparing affidavit of
service.

Review revised Monitor's Report and correspond re: same; review reply
materials; correspond re: reply materials, cross-examination.

Serving Monitor's Third Report and arranging for filing with the Court.

Message for I. Aversa re: Danforth matters; speak to [. Aversa re: Danforth
matters; status update to S. Bissell.

Correspond re: Danforth matter; status update.

Corresponding with J. Desjardins, Aird & Berlis and S. Bissell, FIT re:
disclaimer notice re: lease agreement with Ricoh Canada Inc.

Correspond re: Danforth status update, contract disclaimer; review Danforth
lease documents.

Speak to S. Bissell re: WEPPA, status update; review offer to settle;
correspond re: WEPPA.,

Reviewing correspondence re: settlement between Extreme Fitness and



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adetaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontarie M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #603285 -- page3

Date TKID Hours  Description
1079268 Ontario Inc.; discussing with M., Wagner re: settlement discussions
and re: stay extension motion.

05/08/13 MEW 1.50  Review WEPPA,; correspond re: offer to settle, stay extension hearing; speak
to C. Descours re: stay extension hearing; speak to I. Aversa re: settlement,
stay extension hearing; status update to S. Bissell.

05/09/13  CDS 3.50  Meeting with M. Wagner re: settlement agreement between Extreme Fitness
and 1079268 Ontario Inc.; reviewing settlement agreement and
correspondence re: same; preparing for and attending stay extension motion;
corresponding re: revised draft Order.

05/09/13 MEW 2.50  Review release re: settlement of Danforth matters and correspond re: same;
speak to C. Descours re: settlement, court preparation; speak to I. Aversa re:
settlernent; message for S. Bissell re: settlement; review revised release and
speak to I. Aversa and M. van Zandvoort re: same; correspond re: revised
Order; review revised Order.

05/10/13 MEW 30 Correspond re: landlord assignment, entered stay extension order.

05/15/13 MEW 20  Speak to S. Bissell re: status update.

OUR FEE $18,924.50

TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL

MEW Wagner, Melaney 15.80 hrs $775.00 $12,245.00

CDS Descours, Caroline 13.90 hrs $475.00 $6.602.50

DA Clerk, Litigation 1.10 hrs $70.00 $77.00

$18,924.50

DISBURSEMENTS

Copies 25.00
Telephone - Cellular Phone Charges ' 12.00
Delivery - Courier : 259.27

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

$296.27




Barristers & Solicitors

Lip Bay Adelaide Centre
% 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Gntario MoH 287

Telephone: 416.579.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #603285 -- page 4

TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $18,924.50
HST ON FEES 2,460.19
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 296.27
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE © $296.27
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 38.52
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $21,719.48
TRUST FUNDS $50,000.00

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

/Lﬁa/tau\ﬂ

E. & O.E.
MEW /

e

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



June 25, 2013

Qur File No.: 13.0251
Via Email

FTI Consulting

79 Wellington Street West
Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104

Toronto, ON  MS5K 1G8

Attention: Steven Bissell, Managing Director

Dear Steven:

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario MAH 287

Telsphongs: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.597.4258
mwagner@goodmans.ca

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the above-noted matter.

I trust you find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not

hesitate to contact me.
Yours very truly,

GQRODMANS LLP

ooy

Melaney J. Wagner
MIWiss

Enc,

V6170650

AV



FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
PO Box 104

Toronto, ON

Canada M3K 1G8

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 287

Telephone: 416.579.2211
Facsimile: £16.979.1234
goodmans.ca

June 25, 2013

OUR FILENO.  FTCC 130251

OUR INVOICE NO. 605375
GST/HST REGISTRATION NO. R119422962

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours
05/21/13 MEW 30
05/23/13 MEW .50
05/24/13 MEW .90
05/28/13 MEW .80
05/31/13 MEW .20
06/03/13 MEW 50
06/04/13 MEW .90
06/05/13 MEW 1.80

Description

Message for I. Aversa re: request for status update; speak to S. Bissell re:
status update; correspond re: RBC.

Review correspondence from CRA and correspond re: same; review
correspondence re: Paymentech, lessor assignments.

Conference call with S. Bissell, S. Graff, I. Aversa and A. Hutchens re: CRA
letter, response and next steps; review and provide comments on response
letter to CRA.

Speak to I. Aversa re: Paymentech; conference call with I. Aversa and M.
Sloan re: Paymentech; review correspondence re: CRA.

Review correspondence from CRA.

Review correspondence re: Paymentech and correspond re: same; speak to S.
Bissell re: status update; correspond re: coordinate call to discuss next steps

prior to stay expiry.

Correspond re: Paymentech, adjustment amount under the APA; review
CCAA Termination Orders re: post-termination payments; review
Paymentech agreement.

Review correspondence re: adjustment amount and respond to same; review



Date

06/06/13

06/07/13

06/10/13

06/11/13

06/14/13
06/17/13
06/17/13

06/18/13
06/18/13

06/19/13
06/19/13
06/21/13
06/24/13

TKID

MEW

MEW

MEW

MEW

MEW
CDS
MEW

CDS

MEW

CDS

MEW
MEW
MEW

Hours

S50

.80

S50

50

30

.60

2.30

1.20

2.10
40
30
40

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Strest, Suite 3400
Teronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #605375 -- page 2
Deseription

Paymentech revised agreement; speak toI. Aversa re: Paymentech agreement;
review further revised Paymentech agreement; review response to CRA and
provide comments.

Review correspondence re: CRA, Paymentech, status of lessor consents and
speak to S. Bissell re: same.

Review Paymmﬁech comments on agreement and Aird & Berlis comments re:
same; correspond re: Paymentech agreement; speak to 1. Aversare:
Paymentech agreement.

Review Paymentech comments on agreement and correspond re: same;
review CRA correspondence.

Review response to CRA and provide comments on same; conference call
with I. Aversa, A. Hutchens and Paymentech re: agreement; review revised
Paymentech agreement and correspond re: same.

Speak to Copy Toner of Canada re: pre-filing debt; correspond re:
Paymentech matters.

Reviewing APA re: release of holdback amount and corresponding with M.
Wagner re: same.

Correspond re: Paymentech agreement, adjustment amount, release of
Holdback.

Meeting with M. Wagner to discuss termination of CCAA proceedings and
commencement of bankruptey proceedings; drafting Monitor's report re:
same.

Conference call with G. Moffat, S. Graff, I. Aversa, S. Bissell and B. Taylor
re: next steps; speak to S. Bissell re: wind-down matters, Monitor's Report,
passing of accounts; speak to C. Descours re: Monitor's Report.

Drafting Monitor's fourth report.
Correspond re: Paymentech agreement, release of Holdback.
Correspond re: Paymentech, release of Holback.

Correspond re: Paymentech agreement and arrange for monitor execution of
same.




Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #605375 - page 3

OUR FEE $11,687.50
TKID NAME HOURS RATE TOTAL
MEW Wagner, Melancy 12.20 hrs $775.00 $9,455.00
CDS Descours, Caroline 4.70 hrs $475.00 $2,232.50
$11,687.50
DISBURSEMENTS
Delivery - Courier 10.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $10.00
TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $11,687.50
HST ON FEES 1,519.38
NON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 0.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS ‘ 10.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $10.00
HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT 1.30
TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLEARS) ' $13,218.18

TRUST FUNDS $50,000.00



Rarristers & Solicitors

Bay Adefaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Torante, Ontaric MbH 257

Telephons: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #605375 -- page 4

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

(,// S\ J\'\,_Q,M,/L,@ 1 VM __

E. & O.E.
MEW /

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Svite 3400
Toronte, Ontario M5H 257

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979,1234
goodmans.ca

Direet Line: 416.597,4258
mwagner(@gorodmans.ca

July 3, 2013

Our File No.: 13,0251
Via Email

FTI Consulting

79 Wellington Street West

Suite 2010, P.O. Box 104
Toronto, ON  MSK [(G8

Attention: Steven Bissell, Managing Director

Dear Steven:

Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc,

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the above-noted matter. We have
applied a portion of the retainer in full payment of our invoice and the balance of the retainer remains in trust.

I trust you find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions regarding the enclosed, please do not
hesitate to contact me,

Yours very truly,

SLLP

.r?.: - Q’/i_ _____ ;#g
' ]\';Ielaney J. Wagner \\/

MIW/ss

Enc.

V6170650



Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Terento, Ontario M&H 257

Telephene: 416,979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
gondmans.ca

July 3, 2013
FTI Consulting Canada Inc.
2010 TD Waterhouse Tower
79 Wellington Street West
PO Box 104
Toronto, ON
Canada MSK 1G8

ATTENTION: Steven Bissell -

OUR FILE NO, FICC 130251

OUR INVOICE NO, 606089

GST/HST REGISTRATION NO, R119422962
Re: Extreme Fitness, Inc.

TO OUR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN CONNECTION WITH THE ABOVE NOTED
MATTER INCLUDING THE FOLLOWING:

Date TKID Hours  Description

06/25/13 CDS 230 Drafting Fourth Report and affidavits for approval of Monitor's fees.
06/26/13 CDS 230  Dmafting Fourth Report; meeting with M. Wagner to discuss same.

06/26/13 MEW 1.00  Review and provide comments on Monitor’s Report re: termination of CCAA

proceedings; review and provide comments on fee affidavits.

06/27/13  CDS 2.50  Reviewing and revising draft motion materials; corresponding and discussing
with M. Wagner re: same.

06/27/13 MEW 1.40  Speak to L. Aversa re: termination of CCAA proceedings; review motion
materials re: same and provide comments to C. Descours; review revised
motion materials, :

06/28/13 CDS 2.90  Reviewing draft motion materials, corresponding with M. Wagner and
providing comments to Aird & Berlis re: same; reviewing and revising draft
Fourth Report and corresponding with M. Wagner, S. Bissell and B. Taylor
re: same.

06/28/13 MEW 1.50  Review and revise Monitor’s Report re: termination of CCAA proceedings;
correspond re: sale proceeds.

07/02/13 CDS 420  Reviewing revised draft motion materials for termination of CCAA
proceedings and providing comments re: same; teleconference with S. Bissell



Date TKID Hours  Deseription

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Streat, Suite 3400
Toroato, Ontario MaH 257

Telephone: 416.975.2211
Facsimile: 416.975.1234
goodmans.ca

Invoice #606089 -- page 2

and B. Taylor re; Monitor's Fourth Report and completion of CCAA
proceedings; corresponding with 1. Aversa re: motion materials; reviewing
and revising draft Report, fee affidavits and invoices and discussing with M.

Wagner re: same,

07/02/13 MEW 2.50  Conference call with S. Bissell, B. Taylor and C. Descours re: termination of
CCAA proceedings, court materials; conference call with C. Descours and L.
Aversa re: mechanics for completing CCAA proceedings, court materials;
review and provide comments on revised materials; review passing of
accounts materials and provide comments to C, Descours,

OUR FEE $11,705.60
TKID NAME HGURS RATE TOTAL
MEW Wagner, Melaney 6.40 hrs $775.00 $4,960.00
CDS Descours, Caroline 14.20 hrs $475.00 $6,745.00
$11,705.00
DISBURSEMENTS
Copies 8.25
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 58.25
TOTAL FEES ON THIS INVOICE $11,705.00
HST ON FEES 1,521.65
NON TAXABILE DISBURSEMENTS (.00
TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS 8.25
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ON THIS INVOICE $8.25

HST ON TAXABLE DISBURSEMENT

1.07



Barristers & Sollcitors

Bay Adelaide Cantre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario MAH 257

Telephone: 416.579.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1734
goodmans.ca

Invoice #606089 -- page 3

TOTAL THIS INVOICE (CANADIAN DOLLARS) $13,235.97
LESS PAYMENT FORM TRUST FUNDS ($13,235.97)
TOTAL THIS INVOICE, DUE(CANADIAN DOLLARS) $0.00

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN

GQODMANS LLPA
A \ (
./yf! ! g é »V‘, 1 75 f‘l’}w 42.‘.&/‘% {ﬁ:’r i L
,-E% / ;\Lk\ﬁég h. ‘Ei,%i \ B
] \% /\/
E. & O.E. \

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter o date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Soficifors Act (Ontaric), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.30% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.



This is Exhibit “B” referred to in the
affidavit of Melaney J. Wagner
sworn before me, this 4™

day of July, 2013.

Ch2=——

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits




EXHIBIT “B”

Summary of Goodmans Invoices

Invoices dated February 7, 2013 to July 3, 2013

Invoice # Date Fees Expenses HST Total
596377 February 7, 2013 $40,597.00 $124.80 |  $5,293.83 $46,015.63
596936 | February 25, 2013 $21,662.50 $1,271.81 $2,981.47 $25,915.78
598394 March 13, 2013 $28.342.00 $1,544.33 $3,885.22 $33,771.55
600442 April 4, 2013 $103,294.50 $904.86 | $13,545.92 | $117,745.28
601237 April 22,2013 $8,227.00 $6,430.53 $1,905.48 $16,563.01
603285 May 23, 2013 $18,924.50 $296.27 $2,498.71 $21,719.48
605375 June 25, 2013 $11,687.50 $10.00 $1.520.68 $13,218.18
606089 July 3, 2013 $11,705.00 $8.25 $1,522.72 $13,235.97

TOTAL: $244,440.00 $10,590.85 | $33,154.03 | $288,184.88




This is Exhibit “C” referred to in the
affidavit of Melaney J. Wagner
sworn before me, this 4™

day of July, 2013.
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EXHIBIT “C”

Summary of Goodmans Fees

Services Rendered January 22, 2013 to July 2, 2013

Name Position Hours Hourly Rate Total
M. Wagner Insolvency Partner 163.2 $775.00 $126,480.00
S. Zimmerman | Research Partner 1.0 $875.00 $875.00
K. Herhin Real Estate Partner 1.9 $835.00 $1,586.50
L. Mantello Banking Partner 2.2 $685.00 $1,507.00
C. Descours Insolvency Associate 222.8 $475.00 $105,830.00
P. Bremner Real Estate Law Clerk 11.5 $415.00 $4,772.50
D. Ferreira Corporate Law Clerk 6.7 $290.00 $1,943.00
Articling Students and
Library Support 4.0 $260.00 $1,040.00
Other Support Services 5.8 $70.00 $406.00
TOTAL: 419.1 $244,440.00
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